
KING COUNTY 1200 King County Courthouse

516 Third Avenue

Seattle, WA 98104

1.

2

3

4

5

Signature Report

June 24,2014

Ordinance',7837

Proposed No. 2013-0480.2 Sponsors Phillips

AN ORDINANCE relating to building codes; amending

Ordinance I4ll1, Section 4, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.110, Ordinance 10608, Section 3, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.130, Ordinance 15802, Section 5, and K.C.C.

16.02.152, Ordinance 12560, Section 55, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.170, Ordinance I49I4, Section 13, and

K.C.C. 16.02.180, Ordinance 12560, Section 6, as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.I90, Ordinance 14914, Section

76, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.200, Ordinartce 72560,

Section 10, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.240, Ordinance

12560, Section 17, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.280,

Ordinance 12560, Section 18, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.290, Ordinance 14914, Section 32, and K.C.C.

16.02.300, Ordinance 12560, Section 20, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.340, Ordinance 12560, Section 2I,as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.350, Ordinance 12560, Section

22, as amended, and K.C.C.16.02.360, Ordinance 12560,

Section 13, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.310, Ordinance

12560, Section 14, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.380,

7

8

9

6

10

1,6

18

1.1.

1.2

13

T4

15

17

19

1



Ordinance 17837

Ordinance 12560, Section 25, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.400, Ordinance 12560, Section 26, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.410, Ordinance I49I4, Section 55, and

K.C.C. 16.02.420, Ordinance 14914, Section 57,and

K.C.C. 16.02.440, Ordinance 12560, Section 28,as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.450, Ordinance 12560, Section

30, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.470, Ordinance 12560,

Section 31, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.480, Ordinance

12560, Section 32, as amended, and K.C.C, 16.02.490,

Ordinance 12560, Section 33, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.500, Ordinance 12560, Section 34, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.510, Ordinance 12560, Section 35, as

amended, and K,C.C. 16.02.520, Ordinance 72560, Section

37, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.530, Ordinance 12560,

Section 36, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.540, Ordinance

14914, Section 78, and K.C.C. 16.02.550, Ordinance

12560, Section 9, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.560,

Ordinance I49I4, Section 81, and K.C.C. 16.02.570,

Ordinance 14914, Section 82,as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.580, Ordinance 12560, Section 8, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.590, Ordinance 14914, Section $ 85, and

K.C.C, 16.02.600, Ordinance 14914, Section 90, and

K.C.C. 16.02.020, Ordinance I49I4, Section 133, as

2



Ordinance 17837

amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.260, Ordinance 12560, Section

44, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.270, Ordinance 12560,

Section 47, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.310, Ordinance

I 49 | 4, Section I 44, and K. C. C. | 6.04.320, Ordinance

l4lIl, Section 55, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.330,

Ordinance 14914, Section 151, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.04.340, Ordinance 15802, Section 23, and K.C.C.

16.04.344, Ordinance 15802, Section 24, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.04.346, Ordinance 15802, Section 25,and

K.C.C. 16.04.348, Ordinance 14914, Section 155, and

K.C.C. 16.04.360, Ordinance 14914, Section 269, as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.05.010, Ordinance 14914, Section

274, and K.C.C. 16.05.060, Ordinance 14914, Section277,

as amended, and K.C.C. 16.05.090, Ordinance 74238,

Section 18, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.0i0, Ordinance

14238, Section 19, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.020,

Ordinance 14238, Section 2I,and K.C.C. 16.06.030,

Ordinance I49I4, Section $ 288, and K.C.C. 16.06.031,

Ordinance I 49 I 4, Section 289, and K. C. C. | 6.06.032,

Ordinance I49I4, Section 290,and K.C.C, 16.06.033,

Ordinance I49I4, Section 297,and K.C.C. 16.06.034,

Ordinance 14914, Section 292,and K.C.C. 16.06.035,

Ordinance 14238, Section 27, as amended, and K.C.C.

3



Ordinance 17837

16.06.040, Ordinance 14238, Section 22, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.06.050, Ordinance 14238, Section 23,as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.060, Ordinance 14238, Section

24, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.070, Ordinance 74238,

Section 25, as amended, and K.C.C. i6.06.080, Ordinance

I4Il1, Section 1 18, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.12.010,

Ordinance l4lll, Section 729,as amended, and K.C.C.

16.14.010, Ordinance 12560, Section 109, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.14.090, Ordinance 6746, Section 5, as amended,

and K.C.C. 16.32.030, Ordinance 15802, Section 131, and

K.C.C. 16.32.285, Ordinance 15802, Section 131, and

K.C.C. 11.04.010, Ordinance 15802, Section 131, and

K.C.C. 17.04.020, Ordinance 12560, Section 154, as

amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.230, Ordinance 14111, Section

203, as amended, and K.C,C. 17.04.470, Ordinance 14177,

Section 2I3, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.490, Ordinance

l4I1I, Section 2I0, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.5I0,

Ordinance 1 5 803, Section 6, and K.C.C. 17 .04.522,

Ordinance 6328, Section 4, as amended, and K.C.C.

17.04.530, Ordinance I4llI, Section 2I5, as amended, and

K.C.C. 17.04.540, Ordinance 14915, Section 79, and

K.C.C. 17 .04.550, Ordinance 12560,Section 17 4, as

amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.560, Ordinance 14238, Section

4



Ord nance 17837

29, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.600, Ordinance 14238,

Section 30, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.610, Ordinance

74238, Section 3 1, as amended, and K.C.C. 17 .04.620 and

Ordinance 9726, Section 1, as amended, and K.C.C.

I1.04.630, Ordinance 10870, Section 377, and K.C.C.

21Aj4.170, Ordinance 10870, Section 523, and K.C.C.

21A.28.130, Ordinance 10870, Section 539, and K.C.C.

21A.32.020 and Ordinance 12024, Section 12, and K.C.C,

21A32.230, adding new sections to K.C.C. chapter 16.02,

adding new sections to K.C.C. chapter 16.03 and adding

new sections to K.C.C. chapter 17.04 and repealing

Ordinance 14914, Section 19, and K.C.C. 16.02.220,

Ordinance 15802, Section 9,and K.C.C. 16.02.315,

Ordinance 12560, Section 12, as amended, and K.C.C.

16.02.320, Ordinance 14914, Section 37, and K.C.C.

16.02.330, Ordinance 14914, Section 50, and K.C.C.

16.02.390, Ordinance 74914, Section 56, and K.C.C.

16.02.430, Ordinance 12560, Section 29, as amended, and

K.C.C. 16.02.460, Ordinance 74974, Section 90, and

K.C.C. 16.03.020, Ordinance 12560, Section 40, as

amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.200, Ordinance 12560, Section

41, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.210, Ordinance 14711,

Section 43 as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.280, Ordinance

5



'1.1.2

1.13

1.1.4

L15

1.16

117

118

t!9

120

12L

122

L23

124

125

126

r27

128

1.29

130

T3T

133

1,32

Ordinance 17837

15802, Section 23, and K.C.C, 16.04.350 and Ordinance

74914, Section 341, and K.C.C. 16.14.080.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF KING COUNTY:

SECTION 1. Ordinance l4lII, Section 4, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.110 are

each hereby amended to read as follows:

The International Building Code, ((2009)) 2012Edition, with Appendix C(O) and

E ((and+4)), as amended in chapter 51-50 WAC, Appendix Z, as adopted by this title,

and the International Residential Code for One- and Two Family Dwellings ((2009))

2}l2Bdition, with Appendix ((R)) G, H and K, ((2009)) 2012Edition, as amended in

chapter 51-5 1 
'WAC, 

as published by ol jointly with the International Code Council, Inc.,

together with amendments, additions and deletions adopted in this chapter by reference,

together with the State Building Code Act, chapter 19.27 RCV/, and with King County

modifications that are adopted and codified in this chapter are adopted as the King

County building codes and may be cited as such and are referred to in this chapter as "this

code. "

This code also may be further clarif,red and implemented with administrative rules

adopted in accordance with K.C.C. chapter 2.98.

SECTION 2. Ordinance 10608 , Section 3, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.130 are

each hereby amended to read as follows:

The King County modifications to the ((2006)) 2012 editions of the International

Building Code, International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings,

International Mechanical Code, International Property Maintenance Code, and the

Security Code are adopted as part of the code.

6

134



Ordinance 17837

135 S -1 Ordinance 15802, Section 5, and K.C.C. 16,02.152 are each hereby

136 amended to read as follows:

1.37 Section 101.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

138 is substituted:

139 Scope (IBC 101 .2). The provisions of this code shall apply to the construction,

1,40 alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,

1,41, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of every building or structute or any

1.42 appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.

1.43 EXCEPTIONS:

I44 1. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family

1,4s Dwellings shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,

1.4G replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of

L47 detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings

1.48 (townhouses) not more than three stories in height with a separate means of egress and

1.4g their accessory structures, including adult family homes, foster family care homes and

150 family day care homes licensed by the Washington state department of social and health

151 services

Is2 2. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family

153 Dwellings shall apply to detached residential accessory structures that are used for home

IS4 occupations and home industries that include offices, mercantile, food preparation for

155 off-site consumption, personal care salons and similar uses, if the home occupation or

15G home industry is subordinate to the primary residential use of the site and the total

7



1.57

158

1s9

160

161

L62

1_63

164

165

166

1,67

168

169

t70

171

172

173

174

175

L76

177

178

Ordinance 17837

cumulative floor area devoted to the home occupation or home industry in ((a++)) gry

detached accessory structure((s)) on-site is less than or equal to 500 square feet (46.4m2).

3. The provisions of the International Mechanical Code shall regulate the design,

installation, maintenance, alteration and inspection of mechanical systems that are

permanently installed and utilized to provide control of the environmental conditions and

related processes within buildings. This code shall also regulate those mechanical

systems, system components, equipment and appliances specifically addressed herein,

The installation of fuel gas distribution piping and equipment, fuel gas-fired appliances

and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems shall be regulated by the International Fuel

Gas Code.

SECTION 4. Ordinance 125 60, Section 55, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.170

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 102 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

following:

Moved buildings and temporary buildings (IBC 102.7 Ð.

1. Buildings or structures moved into or within the jurisdiction shall comply with

the provisions for new buildings or structures of the International Building Code, chapter

51-50 WAC, the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings,

chapter 51-51 WAC, the International Mechanical Code, chapter 51-52 
'WAC, 

the

International Fire Code, chapter 51-544 WAC, the Uniform Plumbing Code and

Standards, chapter 51-56 ((an++t-S+)) WAC, the ((Washineæ+a+c)) International

Energy Conservation Code, Commercial. chapter 5 1- 1 1C V/AC and the (($fushing+en

8



Ordinance 17837

I7g ørne+Uui+¿i+Ssor

180 s+uetures))

rB1. EXCEPTION: Group R3 buildings or structures are not required to comply if:

I82 1. The original occupancy classification is not changed, and

183 2. The original building is not substantially remodeled or rehabilitated. For the

L84 purposes of this section a building shall be considered to be substantially remodeled

185 when the costs of remodeling exceed 60 percent of the value of the building exclusive of

186 the costs relating to preparation, construction, demolition or renovation of foundations.

L87 No person shall move within or into the unincotporated areas of King County, or

188 cause to be moved, any building or structure without first obtaining, in addition to the

189 building permit, a relocation investigation permit from the building offrcial. The purpose

190 of this relocation investigation permit is to determine prior to relocation the def,rciencies

19L in the building. Before a structure is relocated to a proposed site, a building permit shall

r92 be obtained.

193 2. The building ofhcial shall not approve for moving nor issue a building permit

194 for a building or structure which constitutes a public nuisance or endangers the public

i.95 health, safety, or general welfare, and in his opinion it is physically impractical to restore

196 such building or structure to make it comply with this code.

I97 3. A fee shall be.charged for relocation investigations and site inspection

198 services. A building permit fee shall also be charged for all structures which are

199 approved for relocation. Fees for permits and services provided under this section shall

2oo be paid to the department of permitting and environmental review as set forth in K.C.C.

201. Tit\e 27 , Building and Constructions Fees. As a condition of securing the building

9



Ordinance 17837

202

203

204

205

206

207

208

209

210

21.1.

21.2

213

2r4

21.5

21.6

217

21,8

219

220

221.

222

permit, the owner of the building or structure shall deposit cash or its equivalent with the

building official, or in an approved irrevocable escrow, in an amount up to $5000.00.

4. Relocation investigation fees do not apply to structures having acceptable

current inspections, such as factory built units.

4.1 If the building official denies a building permit for the relocation of a

structure, the applicant may request, within 10 days of the date of mailing or other

issuance of the denial notice, that building off,rcial refer the building permit application

((Ue+evre¡l*e¿+y)) to the ((B))huilding ((e))eode (('+ppeals)) advisory ((B))þoatd. The

advisory ((B))þoard shall review the application and make a recommendation to the

building ofhcial, who may reconsider the denial in light of the advisory ((B))þoard's

recommendation.

SECTION 5. Ordinance I49I4, Section 13, and K.C.C. 16.02.180 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 102 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

following:

Additions, alterations or repairs (IBC ((+O2S)) W. Additions, alterations

or repairs to any structure shall conform to that required for a new structure without

requiring the existing structure to comply with all of the requirements of this code, unless

otherwise stated. Additions, alterations or repairs shall not cause an existing structure to

become unsafe or adversely affect the performance of the building.

SECTION 6. Ordinance 12560, Section 6, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.190 are

223 each hereby amended to read as follows

10



224

22s

226

227

228

229

230

231.

232

233

234

235

236

237

238

239

240

241

242

243

244

245

Ordinance 17837

Section 104.1 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

is substituted:

General (IBC 104.1). The building offrcial is hereby authorized and directed to

enforce all the provisions of this code, with the exception of International Building Code

(( )) Chapter 29, the fuel gas piping requirements

contained in the International Fuel Gas Code and Chapter 24 of the International

Residential Code. The director of public health is authorized to enforce the provisions of

(( )) Chapter 29 of the International

Building Code, the fuel gas piping requirements contained in the International Fuel Gas

Code and Chapter 24 of the International Residential Code. For such purposes, the

building official and the director of public health shall have the powers of a law

enforcement officer.

The building offrcial shall have the power to render interpretations of this code

and to adopt and enforce rules and supplemental regulations in order to clarify the

application of its provisions. Such interpretations, rules and regulations shall be in

conformance with the intent and purpose of this code.

SECTION 7. Ordinance 14914, Section 16, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.200

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.3 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

is substituted:

the procedures in K.C.C. Title23

1,I

t ofenThe ri shall be in



Ordinance 17837

246 NEV/ SECTION. SECTION 8. A new section is hereby added to K.C.C. chapter

247 16.02 fo read as follows:

248 Section 104.10.1 of the International Building Code is not adopted.

249 SECTION 9. Ordinance 12560, Section 10, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.240

25o are each hereby amended to read as follows:

25L Section 105.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

252 is substituted:

2s3 Work exempt from permit (IBC 105.2). A building permit shall not be required

254 for the following:

2ss Building:

256 1. One-story detached one and two family residential accessory buildings used as

257 tool and storage sheds, playhouses, tree supported structures used for play and similar

258 uses, not including garages or other buildings used for vehicular storage, provided the

259 floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (1 1.15 m2) provided that the roofoverhang

260 does not exceed twenty-four inches measured horizontally from the exterior wall.

261'2.one-storydetachedagriculturalaccessorybuildings'((@

262 sh€dsr)) not including garages or other buildings used for vehicle storage, provided the

263 floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (1 1.I5 m2),provided that the roof overhang

264 does not exceed twenty-four inches measured horizontally from the exterior wall.

26s 3. Fences not over 6 feet (1.829 m) high.

266 a. ((ei+4e+rieks,

1.2



267

268

269

270

27r

272

273

274

275

276

277

278

279

280

281,

282

283

284

285

286

287

Ordinance 17837

5-)) Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1 .219 m) in height measured from

the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or

impounding Class I, II or III-A liquids.

((á)) 5 Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not

exceed 5,000 gallons (18,927 l) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not

exceed 2 to L

((+--p+a$ermq)) 6. ((s))Ëidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (.762

m) above grade and not over any basement or story below and ((whieh)) that are not part

of an accessible route.

((&)) 7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar

finish work.

((+)) 8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

((l+)) 9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R, Division 3

Occupancy as applicable in SectionI07.2, ((¡¡Éhi€h)) that are installed entirely above

ground and are either less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep(O) and do not exceed 5,000

gallons (18,9251) ((and)) or are installed ((@)) for temporarv use of

less than three months in a twelve month period.

((l+)) 10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes,

and not including service systems.

((f+)) 11. Swings and other playground equipment.

((1+)) 12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall ((whieh)) that do not

project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require288

13



Ord nance 17837

289

290

29L

292

293

294

29s

296

297

298

299

300

301

302

303

304

30s

306

307

308

309

310

31,t

additional support of Group R3, as applicable in Section I0I.2, and Group U

Occupancies.

((+4)) 13. Moveable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches (228.6

m) high.

((+t)) 14. Re-roofing of existing buildings.

EXCEPTION: When replacement roofing adds more than 5 pounds per square

foot cumulative dead load to the weight of the original roofing a permit shall be required.

((+-á)) 15. Submerged, freestanding mechanical boat lifts associated with single-

family residential piers and recreational watercraft not exceeding25 feet in length or 15

feet in width with no portion exceeding a height of 10 feet above the ordinary high water

mark as defined in K.C.C. 214.06.825.

((f+)) 16. Work located primarily in a public way, public utility towers and

poles.

((l&)) 17. Mechanical equipment not specifically regulated in this code.

((

2+)) 18. Antenna and dishes that fall under FCC Antenna Rule 47 C.F.R

including masts under twelve feet above the roof line and dishes up to one meter in

diameter.

19. Roof-mounted photo-voltaic solar s from one and two familv dwellinss

uare foot and are moun

above the roof or roof tonw

20. Ground mounted wind turbines for one and two family dwellings &r whþh

any portion of the unit does not exceed twelve feet in heieht.

1.4



Ord nance 17837

3I2 Gas:

313 1. Portable heating appliance.

31,4 2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of

315 equipment or make such equipment unsafe.

316 Mechanical:

3I7 1. Portable heating appliance.

318 2. Portable ventilation appliances and equipment.

319 3. Portable cooling unit.

320 4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling

321. equipment regulated by this code.

322 5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its approval or make it

323 unsafe.

324 6. Portable evaporative cooler.

325 7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or

326 less of refrigerant and actuated by motors of one horsepower (746 V/) or less.

327 8. Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping

328 system and are not interconnected to a power grid.

329 Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing, electrical and mechanical permits

330 will be required for the above-exempted items.

331 Exemption from the permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant

332 authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this

333 code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

15



Ordinance 17837

339 Permit aoolication cancellation shall

334

335

336

337

338

340

341.

342

343

344

345

346

347

348

349

3s0

351

3s2

3s3

354

355

3s6

SECTION 10. Ordinance 72560, Section 17, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.280

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.3.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Expirationofapplication(IBC105.3.2).(())

in accordance with K.C.C. 20.20.100

1. A permit application shall be deemed canceled by the permittee if:

((+=)) 1 .1. The applicant has not taken action or responded;

((l-+)) 1 .1.1. within 60 days after notice of additional information required is

mailed to the applicant, or

((l-4)) 1.1.2. by the deadline specified by the building official for additional

information; or

((L)) 1.2. No permit is issued;

((2-+=)) 1.2.1 within 60 days after the applicant has been notihed that the

permit is ready, or

((+)) L2.2. by a time specified by the building official.

for2 t

section. if:

within the time limits

2.L not later than seven davs prior to exniration date under subsection 1. of

this section. the aoplicant makes a written for an extension of the buildins oermit:

anolicable oermit fees

and

2.2. Íhe applicant pays

16



357

358

359

360

361

362

363

364

365

366

367

368

369

370

371.

372

373

374

375

376

377

378

Ordinance 17837

SECTION 1 1. Ordinance 12560, Section 18, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.290

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

is substituted:

Expiration (IBC 105.5). Every permit ((issìred)) approved by the building

official under the provisions of the Code shall expire by limitation and become null and

void one year from date of its issue. Issued permits may be extended for one year periods

subject to the following conditions:

1. An application for a permit extension together with the applicable fee is

submitted to the deparlment at least seven (7), but no more than sixty (60), calendar days

prior to the date the original permit becomes null and void. Once the permit extension

application is submitted, work may continue past the expiration date of the original

permit, provided that the extension application is not denied. If the extension application

is denied, all work must stop until a valid permit is obtained,

2. If construction of a building or structure has not substantially commenced, as

determined by the building official, within two years from the date of the first issued

permit and the building and the structure is no longer authorized by the zoning code or

other applicable law, then the permit shall not be extended.

3. An applicant may request a total of two permit extensions provided there are

no substantial changes in the approved plans and specihcations.

4. The building official may extend a building permit beyond the second

extension only to allow completion of a building, structure or mechanical system

authorized by the original permit and substantially constructed. If substantial work, as379

17



380

381

382

383

384

385

386

387

388

389

390

391

392

393

394

395

396

397

398

399

400

401.

Ordinance 17837

determined by the building official, has not commenced on a building and/or structure

authorized in the original permit, then a new permit will be required for construction to

proceed.

((

1, The applieant makes a rrritten request te the building effieial fer alr extensien

@;

iens'))

5. The staff of the department may revise a permit at the permittee's request but

such a revision does not constitute a renewal or otherwise extend the life of the permit.

SECTION 12. Ordinance 14914, Section 32,andK.C.C. 16.02.300 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.6 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

is substituted:

Suspension or revocation (IBC 105.6). The building official is authorized to

suspend, revoke or modify the permit approval for a permit issued under the provisions of

this code as provided in K.C.C. 23.24.100 wherever the permit is issued in erlor or on the

basis of incorrect, inaccurate or incomplete information, or in violation of any ordinance

or regulation or any of the provisions of this code.

NEW SECTION. SECTION 13 A new section is hereby added to K.C.C

chapter 16.02 to read as follows:

18



402

403

404

405

406

407

408

409

41,0

4Lt

412

413

41.4

41.5

41,6

417

418

419

420

421,

422

423

Ordinance 17837

Section 106.1 of the International Building Code is.not adopted and thé following

is substituted:

Live loads posted. (IBC 106.1). The design live loads shall be conspicuously

posted by the owner using durable signs, which may not be lawfully removed or defaced,

as follows:

1. For commercial or industrial buildings, the portion or all of each floor for

which the design live load is or has been designed to exceed one hundred twenty five

pounds per square foot; and

2. For all warehouse and storage buildings, the portion or all of each floor

regardless of the design live load.

SECTION 14. Ordinance 125 60, Section 20, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.340

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+4633)) I07.3.3 of the International Building Code is not adopted and

the following is substituted:

Pre-issuance construction authorization (PICA) - Permission to proceed (IBC

((+0633)) 107.3.3). If the applicant for a permit or approval required by this code

desires to commence work before obtaining the required permit or approval, the building

official, may allow the applicant to proceed if:

1. The building offrcial determines that the work would not endanger or harm the

property; and if

2. The building official determines that allowing the work to proceed would not

violate the requirements of the state environmental policy act; and if

T9



424

425

426

427

428

429

430

431

432

Ordinance 17837

3. The applicant first deposits cash or its equivalent with the building official, or

in an irrevocable escrow approved by the building official, in an amount determined by

the building official to be suffrcient to restore the building and site, and to perform the

corrective work described below.

SECTION 15. Ordinance 12560, Section 21, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.350

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((l€633)) 107 .3.3 of the International Building Code is supplemented

with the following:

Pre-issuance construction authorization (PICA) - Removal of work not

433 permitted and restoration (IBC ((+O6.3.}J)) 107.3.3.1 . An applicant who commences

434 work pursuant to Section ((+€63=}t)) 107.3.3.1 must, within the time specified by the

435 building official, remove all work which does not receive the required permit or approval

43G or which does not comply with the terms of a permit or approval which is obtained. The

437 applicant must also restore the building and site to a condition satisfactory to the building

438 official and perform whatever additional correction work is deemed necessary by the

439 building official.

440 SECTION 16. Ordinance 12560, Section 22, as amended, and K.C.C.16.02.360

441, are each hereby amended to read as follows:

442 Section ((+0633.)) 107.3.3) of the International Building Code is supplemented

443 with the following:

444 Pre-issuance construction authorization (PICA) - Enforcement (((+063-3+))

44s 107.3.3.2\). If an applicant fails to comply with the requirements of Section ((+06.+.+.2))

446 I07 .3.3.2), the building offrcial may employ the code enforcement procedures set forth in

20



Ordinance 17837

447 K.C.C. Title 23 and may, in addition, obtain the funds on deposit and apply them towards

448 removal of the unpermitted work, restoration of the building and site, and performance of

449 whatever additional corrective work is deemed necessary by the building ofÍicial. In the

450 event the applicant obtains the necessary permits or approvals or performs the corrective

4st work to the satisfaction of the building offrcial, the funds or deposit shall be released to

452 the applicant.

453 SECTION 17. Ordinance 12560, Section 13, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.370

454 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

455 Section ((l€63-4J)) 107 .3.4 of the International Building Code is not adopted

456 and the following is substituted:

457 General (IBC ((+e63.4+)) 107.3.4). When it is required that documents be

458 prepared by an architect or engineer, the building official may require the owner to

459 engage and designate on the building permit application an architect or engineer who

460 shall act as the architect or engineer of record. If the circumstances require, the owner

46I may designate a substitute architect or engineer of record who shall perform all of the

462 duties required of the original architect or engineer of record. The building official shall

463 be notified in writing by the owner if the architect or engineer of record is changed or is

464 unable to continue to perform the duties.

465 The architect or engineer of record shall be responsible for reviewing and

466 coordinating all submittal documents prepared by others, including deferred submittal

467 items, for compatibility with the design of the building.

468 'When 
an engineer or architect is required by King County for the structural

469 design of a commercial or multi-family residence building, the department will not

21



Ordinance 17837

470 review and approve a project which has multiple engineers or architects (or engineering

471. firms) unless the owner employs an engineer or architect responsible for the overall

472 structural design. This engineer or architect responsible for the overall structural design

473 shall write a letter to the department documenting that he/she is the engineer ot architect

474 of record designated by the project owner to be lesponsible fol the overall structural

475 design, and that he/she has reviewed the entire structural design to ensure compliance

476 with the International Building Code.

477 SECTION 18. Ordinance 12560, Section 14, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.380

478 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

479 Section ((+€63=4)) I07.3.6 of the International Building Code is supplemented

480 with the following:

4BI Inspection and observation program (IBC ((+e63.43)) 107.3.6). 'When

482 special inspection is required by Section 1704,the architect or engineer of record shall

483 prepare an inspection program which shall be submitted to the building official for

484 approval. The inspection program shall designate the portions of the work that require

485 special inspection and the name or names of the individuals or firms who are to perform

486 the special inspections, and indicate the duties of the special inspectors. The special

487 inspector shall be employed by the owner, the engineer or architect of record, or an agent

488 of the owner, but not the contractor or any other person responsible for the work.

489 V/hen structural observation is required by Section 1709, the inspection program

490 shall name the individuals or firms who are to perfolm structural observation and

4gI describe the stages of construction at which structural observation is to occur.

22



494

492

493

495

496

497

498

499

Ordinance 17837

The inspection proglam shall include samples of inspection repofis and provide

time limits for submission of reports.

SECTION 19. Ordinance 12560, Section 25, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.400

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 108 and all subsections thereto of the International Building Code are not

adopted and the following is substituted:

Fees (IBC 108). Fees shall be assessed according to K.C.C. Title27. ((#erthe

pubtishcd by leBO in500

TETAL VALUATIEN FEE

$+-00+€$5e0$O $æée

W
ine

$2$ooso

W

:'^^1.,1:-^ o1< nn^ nn
I¡t::JFruqrlró altLJ)vvv.vv

W

i'^^1.,1:-^ o<rì nnn AA
]nvluullró !PJVrvVv.vv

W

23



Ordinance 17837

:,-^r.,r:-^ ol nA nnn rì^
I]:]:@õ q,rvvrvvv.vv

W

:.^^'t,,1:-^ o1 
^Arì 

n^n Arì
Irrv]:w-rrõ !1, l,vvv,vvv. vv

501 SECTION 20. Ordinance 12560, Section 26, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.410

5o2 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

503 Section ((149'l)) 1 10.1 .1 of the International Building Code is supplemented with

504 the following:

sos Inspection record card (IBC ((+O9-1J)) 110.1.1). Work requiring a permit shall

506 not be commenced until the pelmit holder or an agent of the permit holder shall have

sot posted or otherwise made available an inspection record card in a conspicuous place on

508 the premises and in a position such as to allow the building official to conveniently make

509 the required entries thereon regarding inspection of the work. This card shall be

510 maintained available in such a position by the permit holder until the Certificate of

511 Occupancy has been issued. For R-3 and U occupancies and structures built under the

sI2 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, this card shall serve

513 as the certificate of occupancy. If more than two units are located on the same lot, the

514 Certificate of Occupancy shall be used. The validated hard copy of the building permit

24



515

s16

517

518

519

s20

521.

522

523

524

525

526

527

s28

s29

s30

s31

532

533

s34

535

536

Ordinance 17837

application given to the applicant at the time of the permit issuance shall serve as the

inspection record card. This validated hard copy of the building permit application shall

hereafter be referred to as the building permit.

SECTION 21. Ordinance 14914, Section 55, and K,C.C. 16.02.420 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((l€933)) 110.3.3 of the International Building Code is not adopted and

the following is substituted:

Lowest floor elevation (IBC ((149.33)) 110.3.3). In flood hazard areas, upon

placement of the lowest floor, including the basement, and prior to fuither vertical

construction, the elevation certification required in section 1612.5 and in K.C.C. chapter

21A.24 shall be submitted to the building official.

SECTION 22. Ordinance 14914, Section 57, and K.C.C. 16.02.440 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((l€ry)) fi0.3.7 of the International Building Code is not adopted and

the following is substituted:

Energy efficiency inspections (IBC ((+e93-Ð) 110.3.7). Energy effrciency

inspections shall be in accordance with the ((Washingte+S+a+c)) International Energy

Conservation Code, as adopted and amended by chapter 51-11 (C) and 51-11 (R) WAC.

SECTION 23. Ordinance 12560, Section 28, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.450

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((l€95)) 110.5 of the International Building Code is supplemented with

the following:

25



Ord nance 17837

537

s38

s39

540

54r

542

543

544

545

546

547

548

549

550

551

552

553

5s4

5s5

5s6

557

558

559

Reinspections (IBC ((1eq5+)) 110.5.1). A reinspection fee may be assessed for

each inspection or reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called

is not complete or when corrections called for are not made.

This subsection is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time

a job is rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as

controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such

inspection or reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted

or otherwise available on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the

inspector, for failule to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or

for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant must request a reinspection and pay the

reinspection fee as set forth in the fee schedule adopted by K.C.C. Title 27 .

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection

of the wolk will be performed until the required fees have been paid,

SECTION 24. Ordinance 12560, Section 30, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.470

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+læ)) lII.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Certificates issued (((UBæ)) IBC 111.2). The building offrcial may issue

either a cerlificate of occupancy or a certificate of shell completion.

SECTION 25. Ordinance 12560, Section 31, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.480

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

26



Ordinance 17837

560 Section ((++æ)) 1IL2 of the International Building Code supplemented with the

s61 following:

562 CertifÏcate of occupancy (IBC ((++s.?t)) lll.2.l). After final inspection, if no

563 violations of this code or of related land use and public health ordinances, rules and

564 regulations have been discovered, or ifsuch violations have been discovered and

565 corrected, the building offrcial shall issue a certificate of occupancy which shall contain

s66 the following:

567 1. The building permit number.

568 2. The address of the building.

569 3. The name and address of the owner.

570 4. A description of that portion of the building for which the certificate is issued.

571. 5. The name of the building offrcial.

572 6. A statement that the building may be occupied.

573 7. The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.

574 8. The use and occupancy, in accordance with the provisions of chapter 3.

515 9. The type of construction as def,tned in chapter 6.

516 10 The design occupant load.

577 i 1. If an automatic sprinkler system is provided, whether the sprinkler system is

578 required.

579 12. Any special stipulation and conditions of the building permit.

580 13. An explanation that the responsibility for the building's compliance with the

581 provisions of the applicable King County codes and for maintenance of the building rests

582 exclusively with the permit applicants and their agents and the building's owners.

27



Ordinance 17837

583 SECTION 26. Oñinance 12560, Section 32, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.490

584 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

s8s Section ((llæ)) fiL.2 of the International Building Code is supplemented with

586 the following:

s87 Certificate issued - Certificate of shell completion (IBC ((++æ)) 111.2.2).

588 After final inspection of a building or structure for which the permit was issued for only

589 the building shell, if no violations of this code or of related land use and public health

590 ordinances, rules and regulations have been discovered, or ifsuch violations have been

591 discovered and have been corrected, the building offrcial shall issue a certificate of shell

592 completion which shall contain the following:

593 1. The building permit number.

s94 2. The address of the building.

595 3. The name and address of the owner.

s96 4. A description of the building or that portion of the building for which the

597 certif,rcate is issued.

s98 5. The name of the building off,rcial.

599 6. A statement that no portion of the building shall be occupied until tenant

600 improvement permits are obtained and occupancy is approved.

601 7. The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.

602 8. The type of construction as defined in chapter 6.

603 9. If an automatic sprinkler system is provided, whether the sprinkler system is

604 required.

605 10. Any special stipulation and conditions of the building permit.

28



606

607

608

61.3

61.4

615

6L6

Ordinance 17837

1 1. An explanation that the responsibility for the building's compliance with the

provisions of the applicable King County codes and for maintenance of the building rests

exclusively with the permit applicants and their agents and the building's owners.

609 SECTION 27. Ordinance 12560, Section 33, as amended, and K.C.C. i6.02.500

610 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

61.1. Section ((++æ)) 111.3 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

612 following is substituted

Temporary certificates issued (IBC ((1+s3)) 111.3).

The building ofhcial may issue a temporary certificate of occupancy or a

temporary certificate of shell completion.

SECTION 28. Ordinance 72560, Section 34, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.510

617 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((++æ)) 111.3 of the International Building Code is supplemented with

the following:

Temporary certificate of occupancy (IBC ((1+s.3J)) 111.3.1). The building

official may issue a temporary certificate of occupancy authorizing occupancy of all or

part of an unfinished building or structure or a temporary structure if:

1. The building offìcial determines that construction is substantially completed in

the area to be occupied and that essential health, safety and environmental items have

been adequately constructed or installed in compliance with the codes;

2. The temporary certificate of occupancy shall contain the same information as a

certificate of occupancy along with a list of requirements that remain to be completed,

special conditions of temporary occupancy, and dates of temporary occupancy approval

618

619

620

621,

622

623

624

625

626

627

628

29



Ord nance 17837

629 and expiration. The temporary certificate of occupancy shall be valid only so long as

630 determined by the building official, and only so long as the occupants of the building or

631 structure strictly abide by the conditions and limitations specihed in the temporary

632 certificate of occupancy, and only so long as applicable permits are validly maintained or

633 renewed.

634 SECTION 29. Ordinance 12560, Section 35, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.520

635 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

636 Section ((++æ)) 11 1.3. of the International Building Code supplemented with the

637 following:

638 Temporary certifïcate of shell completion (IBC ((1ls.}3)) 111.3.2). The

639 building official may issue a temporary certif,rcate of shell completion authorizing

640 occupancy for all or part of an unfinished building or structure or a temporary structure

641 if:

642 1. The building offrcial determines that construction is substantially completed

643 and that essential health, safety and environmental items have been adequately

644 constructed or installed in compliance with the codes;

645 2. The temporary certificate of shell completion shall contain the same

646 information as the certificate of shell completion along with a list of requirements that

647 remain to be completed, special conditions of temporary shell approval, and the dates of

648 temporary shell approval and expiration, The temporary certificate of shell completion

649 shall be valid only so long as those responsible for the building and structure strictly

650 abide by the conditions and limitations specified in the temporary certihcate of shell

651 completion, and only so long as applicable permits are validly maintained or renewed.

30



Ord nance 17837

652

6s3

654

655

6s6

657

658

659

660

661

662

663

664

66s

666

667

668

669

670

671.

672

673

674

SECTIoN 30. Ordinance 12560, Section 37, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.530

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((l+4J)) llI.4 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Revocation (IBC ((++O-4)) 111.4). The building official may, in writing, suspend

or revoke a certificate of occupancy and/or a certificate of shell completion issued under

the provisions of this code whenever the certificate is issued in error, or on the basis of

incorrect information supplied, or when it is determined that the building or structure or

portion thereof is in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of

this code,

SECTION 31. Ordinance 12560, Section 36, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.540

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+lO)) 111 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

following:

Posting (IBC ((++eÐ) !11Ð. The certificate of occupancy andlor the certificate

of shell completion shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises and shall not

be removed except by the building official.

SECTION 32. Ordinance 14914, Section 78, and K.C.C. 16.02.550 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Sections ((l+t-++n++++3)) II2.I and 112.2 of the International Building Code

are not adopted.

SECTION 33 Ordinance 12560, Section 9, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.560

are each hereby amended to read as follows

31



Ordinance 17837

67s Section ((+lr+)) 1 13. 1 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

676 following is substituted:

6i7 General (IBC ((1+;H)) 113.1). In order to hear and discuss ((rypeal€-€Ð)

678 decisions or determinations referred to it and made by the building ofhcial on this code as

679 it applies to alternative materials and methods of construction, there shall be and is

680 hereby created a building code advisory board ((e+appeals)). The advisory board shall

681 consist of nine members who are qualified by experience and training to pass upon

682 matters pertaining to building construction. ((The building effieial shall be an ex effreie

683 )) The

684 advisoq' board ((eÊappeals)) members shall be appointed by the county executive,

685 confirmed by the county council, and shall serve four-year terms or until their successorg

686 ((is)) are appointed and confirmed. The advisoq, board shall adopt reasonable rules of

G87 procedure for conducting its business, and shall ((rcndcr)) make all ((deeisien+and

688 findings)) recommendations in writing to the ((appe+a*)) building official with a

689 duplicate copy to the ((@)) applicant. The recommendation shall be

690 advisory unless otherwise specified in this code. The advisory board may also

69L recommend to the ((€ouneil)) buildine official new legislation regarding the subject

692 matter of this code.

693 SECTION 34. Ordinance 14974, Section 81, and K.C.C. 16.02.570 are each

694 hereby amended to read as follows:

69s Section ((llr3)) 113.3 of the International Building Code is not adopted.

696 SECTION 35. Ordinance 14914, Section 82,as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.580

697 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

32



Ordinance 17837

698 Section ((l-l3J)) 114.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

699 following is substituted:

7oo Notice of violation (IBC ((+l33)) 114.2). The building offrcial is authorized to

701, serve a notice of violation or order on the person responsible for the erection,

702 construction, alteration, extension, repair, moving, equipping, removal, demolition or

703 occupancy of a building, structure or equipment or maintaining mechanical systems or

704 equipment in violation of the provisions of the code, or in violation of a permit or

7os certificate issued under the provisions of this code. Such order shall direct the

706 discontinuance of the illegal action or condition and the abatement of the violation in

707 accordance with K.C.C . Title 23.

708 SECTION 36. Ordinance 12560, Section 8, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.590

7og are each hereby amended to read as follows:

710 Section ((++4)) 1 15 and all subsections thereto of the International Building Code

71.1. is not adopted and the following is substituted:

712 Stop orders and correction notice (IBC ((lJr'+)) 115.1). Vy'henever any work

71,3 is being done contrary to the provisions of this code, the building official may order the

71.4 work stopped in accordance with K.C.C. Title 23 by notice in writing served on any

71,5 persons engaged in the doing or causing such work to be done, or by posting such notice

71,6 in a conspicuous place on the premises where the violation is occurring, and any such

717 persons shall forthwith stop such work until authorizedby the building ofhcial to proceed

718 with the work.

719 Whenever any work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code, the

720 building official may order the violations corrected without ordering all work stopped by

33



Ord nance 17837

721. issuing a corection notice which identifies the violation. The correction notice may

722 require reinspection prior to further construction or at the time of the next required

723 inspection. The correction notice shall be served or posted in the same manner as a stop

724 work order.

725 These remedies are in addition to those authorized elsewhere in the code.

726 SECTION 37. Ordinance 14914, Section $ 85, and K.C.C. 16.02.600 are each

727 hereby amended to read as follows:

728 Section ((++5)) 116 of the International Building Code is not adopted.

7zs NEW SECTION. SECTION 38. A new section is hereby added to K.C.C.

73o chapter 16.03 to read as follows:

731. Section 201.3 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

732 following:

733 Terms defïned in other codes (IBC 201.3.1). V/here terms are not defined in

134 this code and are defined in K.C.C. Title 9, 14, 19A,2lA or 23, such terms shall have the

735 meanings ascribed to them in those Titles.

736 SECTION 39. Ordinance 14914, Section 90, and K.C.C. 16.03.020 are each

737 hereby amended to read as follows:

738 The following dehnitions in section 202 of the International Building Code are

739 not adopted:

740 A. Base flood;

74r B. Design flood;

742 C. Dry floodproofing;

743 D. Existing construction;

34



Ordinance 17837

744 E. Flood hazard area;

745 F. Flood hazard area subject to high velocity wave action;

746 G. Flood insurance rate map (FIRM);

747 H. Flood insurance study;

I. Floodway;

J. Hish-Rise Building:

K. Nonbuilding structure((;));

((K)) L. Start of construction; and

((L)) M. Substantial improvement.

NEW SECTION. SECTION 40. A new section is hereby added to K.C,C.

chapter 16.03 to read as follows:

High-Rise Building: a building with an occupied floor located more than 65 feet

above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

SECTION 41. Ordinance 14914, Section 133, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.260

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 503.1 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

following:

Portable classrooms - Fire hydrants and access (IBC 503.1.4). The location of

portable classrooms on a site with existing buildings shall be approved by the Fire

((@ien))Marshalwithrespecttohydrantlocations,acceSS

roads and available water for hre fighting purposes.

SECTION 42. Ordinance 12560, Section 44, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.270

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

748

749

750

751.

752

753

754

755

756

757

758

759

761.

762

763

764

765

760

766

35



Ordinance 17837

767 Section 503.1 of the International Building Code is supplemented with the

768 following:

769 Portable classrooms - Location (IBC 503.1.5). Portable classrooms located

770 within 60 feet of any permanent buildings shall be located with a minimum clear space of

771. 20 feet from any other portable classrooms and from the permanent buildings.

772 EXCEPTIONS:

773 1. Portable classrooms located in close proximity to each other and more than 60

774 feet from permanent buildings, may be considered as portions of one building with no

775 minimum clearance or protection between them. The aggregate area of a cluster of

776 portable classrooms considered as one building must meet the area limits specified in

777 Section 503.

778 2. Portable classrooms located more than 20 feef from main buildings with

779 exterior wall protection that is continuous through the crawlspace or skirted area may be

780 located as follows:

781 2.1 . When either of two porlables has exterior wall protection rated for not less

782 than one hour, with no openings or openings that comply with the area limits of Section

783 ((704=8)) 705.8, the minimum clear space shall be 10 feet from any other portable.

784 2.2. When both of two portables have exterior wall protection rated for not less

785 than one hour with no openings, the minimum clear space shall be 5 feet from any other

786 portable.

787 3. Portable classrooms may be placed within 60 feet of any building provided

788 that the buildings comply with area limitations in Section 503 as may be modified by

789 Section 506. Calculations substantiating compliance of existing and proposed buildings

36



Ordinance 17837

790 with Section 503 as modified by Section 506 will be required as part of the perrnit

T9L applicationdocuments.

792 SECTION 43 Ordinance 12560, Section 47,as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.310

793

794

795

796

797

798

799

800

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((903=2J€)) 903.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and

the following is substituted:

((+U-eeeup*neies)) Where required. (IBC ((903å.10)) 903.2). Sprinklers are

required as follows:

1. For residential units and their accessory structures built under the International

Residential Code, sprinklers shall be installed in accordance with Section ((90}.?*e.zl))

903.2.13.

801 2. For all other occupancies, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in

8021ocationsinaccordancewithSections((9o#t))903.2.1through((9€#))

803 903.2.12

805 exclusivelvfortelecommunicationsequipment. associated electrical Dower distribution

804

and806 vided those of

8o7 throughout with an automatic smoke delçcIþn¡vstcrn lq accordance with Section907.2

and are separated from the remainder of the buildins bv not less than 1-hour f,ire barners

constructed in accordance with Section 707 or not less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies

constructed in accordance with Section 71 1, or both.

3. Sprinklers are also required in occupancies requiring 2,000 gallons per minute

or more fire flow, or where the total floor area included within the surrounding exterior

808

809

810

81,1,

812

37



813

8L4

815

816

817

818

819

820

821.

822

823

824

825

826

827

828

829

830

831

832

833

834

Ordinance 17837

walls on all floor levels including basements exceeds 10,000 square feet. ((Fi+e

sys+em,))

SECTION 44. Ordinance 1491 4, Section l44,and K.C.C. 16.04.320 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((90æ)) 903.2.11.3 of the International Building Code is not

adopted and the following is substituted:

Buildings over 55 feet in height (IBC ((90}å.*}3)) 903.11.3). An automatic

sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings with a floor used for human

occupation that is located 55 feet (16,764 mm) or more above the lowest level of fire

department vehicle access.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Airport control towers.

2. Openparking structures.

SECTION 45. Ordinance l4lll, Section 55, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.330

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((903=}1o)) 903.2 of the International Building Code is supplemented

with the following:

((All)) IRC occupancies (IBC ((903+"+s4)) 903.2.13). An automatic sprinkler

system shall be installed in residential units and accessory structures built under the

International Re s i denti al C o de ((un¿er+nese-eendi+iens)) as fo I I o ws :

38



Ord nance 17837

835 t. ((gxeee¿i+g)) If the gross floor area exceeds 2,500 square feet ((gress-+eer

836 area)) (including attached garages) without adequate fire flow except as cited in K.C.C.

837 17.08.030(O);

838 2. (($¿115""1)) If there is no approved fire department access as defined in the

839 road standards of (( )) K.C.C. Title 14:

840 3, If 2,000 gallons per minute or more fire flow is required, or where the total

841. floor area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all floor levels including

842 basements exceeds 10,000 square feet. For townhouses each unit is considered a separate

843 building.

844 EXCEPTIONS: Attached decks, exterior porches and carports open on two

84s sides(O); or

846 4. Where special hazards or unusual conditions exists in addition to the normal

847 hazard of the space due to the design, size, volume or use of the space, the Fire Marshal

848 is authorized to require additional safeguards suitable for the protection of the hazard or

849 condition involved. Additional safeguards can consist of automatic fire alarm system,

850 automatic sprinkler or water spray system, standpipe and hose, fixed or portable fire

851 extinguishers, or other special hre-extinguishing systems. Where such systems are

852 provided, they shall be designed and installed in accordance with the applicable

8s3 ((æifsrm)) International Fire Code Standards.

854 SECTION 46. Ordinance I49I4, Section 151, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.340

s55 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

856 Section 907.1 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the following

857 is substituted:

39



Ord nance 17837

858

8s9

860

861

862

863

864

865

866

867

868

869

870

871.

872

873

874

875

876

877

878

879

880

General (IBC 907.1). This section applies to the application, installation,

performance and maintenance of fire alarm systems and their components in new and

existing buildings and structures. Section907.3 applies to existing buildings and

structures.

All occupancies exceeding 3,000 square feet gross floor area are required to

provideanappIoVedmonitoredautomaticfiredetectionsystem.((@

))

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Group U occupancies.

2. Residential units and accessory buildings built under the International

Residential Code.

3. Heat detectors are not required in occupancies protected throughout by an

approved and monitored automatic sprinkler system.

SECTION 47. Ordinance 75802, Section 23,and K.C.C. 16.04.344 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((1€08=ß)) 1008.1.4 of the International Building Code is not adopted

and following is substituted:

Special Doors (IBC((1O08"13)) 1008.1.4 Special doors and security grilles

shallcomplywiththerequirementsofsections(())

1008. 1.4. 1 through 1008. 1.4.5.

SECTION 48. Ordinance 15802, Section 24, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.346

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

40



881

882

883

884

88s

886

887

888

889

890

891

892

893

894

89s

896

897

898

899

900

901

902

Ordinance 17837

Section ((1€08-13)) 1008.1.4 of the International Building Code is supplemented

with the following:

Mini-storage facilify storage room doors (IBC (({S08-l=#)) 1008.1.4.5). The

access doors to storage rooms in mini-storage facilities shall meet the provisions of

1008.1 .2 and ((l€O&.*3)) 1 008.1

EXCEPTION: If the storage room has less than 300 square feet of floor area, the

access doors are not required to meet the provisions of 1008.1 .2 and ((+€08-13))

1008.1.9 under the following circumstances:

1. If the facility has any storage room with 300 square feet or less of floor area, at

least one storage room shall comply with 1008.1.2 and ((t008-t-3)) 1008.1.9; and

. 2. For every 10 storage rooms with 300 square feet or less of floor area,the

facility has at least one additional storage room with a door that complies with 1008.1.2

and ((1008=13)) 1 008. 1.9.

SECTION 49. Ordinance i5802, Section 25,and K.C.C. 16.04.348 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+€09J)) 1009 of the International Building Code is supplemented with:

Stairways to mechanical rooms (IBC ((+O09-P)) 1009.18) Platforms and

rooms, used only to attend equipment, that are less than 300 square feet in area or have

less than 5((1)) feet headroom are exempted from the requirement of sections 1009.1 to

((r€0+r)) 100e.17.

SECTION 50. Ordinance 14914, Section 155, and K.C.C. 16.04.360 are each

hereby amended to read as follows

4T



903

904

905

906

907

908

909

910

911

912

913

91,4

915

91.6

917

918

91.9

920

921.

922

923

924

925

Ordinance 17837

Section 1203.3.2 of the International Building Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Exceptions (IBC 1203.3.2). The following are exceptions to section 1203.3 and

t203.3.t:

1. Where warranted by climatic conditions, ventilation openings to the outdoors

are not required if ventilation openings to the interior are provided.

2. The total area of ventilation openings is permitted to be reduced to 111500 of

the under-floor area where the ground surface is treated with an approved vapor retarder

material and the required openings are placed so as to provide cross ventilation of the

space.

3. Ventilation openings are not required where continuously operated mechanical

ventilation is provided al a rale of one cubic foot per minute for each fifty square feet of

crawl-space floor area and the ground surface is covered with an approved vapor retarder.

4. Ventilation openings are not required when the ground surface is covered with

an approved vapor Letarder, the perimeter walls are insulated and the space is conditioned

in accordance with the ((Washing+€+-s+a+e)) International Energy Conservation Code,

Commercial chapter 51-i 1C WAC and International Energy Conservation Code.

Residential. chapter 51-l1R WAC

SECTION 51. Ordinance 14914, Section 269,as amended, and K.C.C. 16.05.010

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

The International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings Code, as

amended in chapter 51-52 WAC, effective July 1, ((2007)) 2013, as published by or

jointly with the International Code Council, Inc., together with appendices, amendments,

42



928

930

926

927

929

931

932

933

934

935

936

937

938

939

940

941,

942

943

944

945

946

947

Ordinance 17837

additions, deletions and exceptions hereinafter adopted by reference, together with the

'Washington 
state building code and with King County modifications which shall be

adopted and codified in this chapter are adopted as the King County International

Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings code and hereinafter refened to as

the International Residential Code, "IRC." Chapter 11 and Chapters 25 through 40 are

not adopted. The energy code is regulated by the International Energy Conservation

Code. chapter 51-1lR WAC; the plumbing code is regulated by chapter 51-56 WAC;the

electrical code is regulated by chapter 296-468 WAC; and Appendix G is included in

adoption of the International Residential Code.

SECTION 52. Ordinance 14914, Section 274, and K.C.C. 16.05.060 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((R3€95)) R309.3 of the International Residential Code is not adopted

and the following is substituted:

Flood hazard areas (IRC ((R3095)) 309.3). Garage floors in buildings located

in flood hazard areas shall comply with the flood hazard standards in K.C.C. chapter

2t1'.24.

SECTION 53. Ordinance 14914, Section 277, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.05.090

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R404. I.2 of the International Residential Code is supplemented with the

following:

Concrete foundation walls (IRC R404.1.2). ((

bceonstrueted as previded in Table 104,1,1(5) and shall alse eemply rvith seetierrR404

948

43



Ord nance 17837

949 )) l, Concrete

950 foundation walls may comply with Table 1805.5(6) of the International Building Code, as

951 amended by K.C.C. chapter 16.04, as an alternative to requiring a special design for

952 every application.

953 SECTION 54. Ordinance 14238, Section 18, as amended, and K.C.C. 16,06.010

954 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

955 Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

956 supplemented with the following:

es7 Purpose (IBC ((34+l-+)) 3413.1). The purpose of K.C.C. 16.06.020 through

958 16.06.080 is to provide a defined level of repair for buildings and structures damaged by

959 a disaster resulting in a declared emergency as defined in K.C.C. 16.20.080. K.C.C.

960 16.06.020 through 16.06.080 are not intended to modify requirements that would

961 otherwise apply under the Washington state energy code, chapter 19.27 A RCW or

962 provisions in buildings for aged and handicapped persons, chapter 70.92 RCV/.

963 SECTION 55. Ordinance 14238, Section 19, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.020

964 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

965 Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

966 supplemented with the following:

967 Critical structures (IBC ((34+l-?)) 3413.2). For the purpose of the International

968 Building Code, a "critical structure" means a structure that may require a higher level of

969 repair after a disaster because of its construction, use, height in stories, occupant load or

970 location and is one or more of the following:

44



Ord nance 17837

971.

972

973

974

975

976

977

978

979

980

981

982

983

984

985

986

987

988

989

990

991

992

1. A masonry structure constructed without structural reinforcement or reinforced

only with joint reinforcement;

2. A structure classified as Category III or IV for importance factor as defìned by

Table 1604.5 IBC;

3. A structure that is four or more stories in height;

4. A structure that contains a Group H occupancy, as defined in IBC 307; or

5. A structure that is located in a seismic or landsli de hazard area, as designated

in the King County Sensitive Areas Map Folio.

SECTION 56. Ordinance 14238, Section 2I, and K.C.C. 16.06.030 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Structural repairs (IBC ((34{13)) 3413.3). Required structural repair levels

shall be based on the ratio of the estimated cost of repairs required to restore the

structural members to their pre-event condition to the estimated replacement cost of the

structure.

SECTION 57. Ordinance I49l4, Section ô 288, and K.C.C. 16.06.031 are each

hereby amended to read as follows

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Required structural repair level for a damage ratio of ten percent or less.

'When the damage ratio is ten percent or less, structures,(rBC ((341r-+t)) 3413.3.1

45



Ordinance 17837

993 except critical structures, as defined in K.C.C. 16.06.020, must be restored, as a

994

995

996

997

1000

minimum, to their pre-event condition.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Replacement of structural masonry shall always be provided with

reinforcement.

998 2. Structural masonry repairs shall be based on the recommendation of the

999 engineer ofrecord

SECTION 58. Ordinance 14974, Section 289, and K.C.C. 16.06.032 are each

1001 hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Required structural repair level for a damage ratio greater than ten percent

but no more than fifty percent (IBC ((34+l-+;¿)) 3413.3.2).

1. Structures, except critical structures, as defined K.C.C. 16.06.020, shall have

the damaged structural members, including all critical ties and connections associated

with the damaged structural members, all structural members supported by the damaged

member, and all structural members supporting the damaged members repaired, replaced

or strengthened to bring them into compliance with the connection requirements and

eighty percent of the force levels of the International Building Code.

EXCEPTION: For structures with rigid diaphragms where the above-required

repair and strengthening increases the rigidity of the resisting members, the entire lateral-

force-resisting system of the structure shall be investigated. When, in the opinion of the

1.002

1003

1004

1005

1006

tooT

1008

1009

1010

1011

rot2

1013

1.01.4

46



1015

1016

1017

1018

1019

1,020

1021.

1.022

1.023

1.024

1.O25

1.026

1.027

1.028

1.029

1030

1031

1,032

1033

1034

1035

1036

Ordinance 17837

building ofhcial, an unsafe or adverse condition has been created as a result of the

increase in rigidity, the condition shall be corrected.

2. When the structure is not a critical structure, as defined in K.C.C. 16.06.020,

conventional stud framed structures, which contain detached one or two family

dwellings, or detached occupancies classified as Group R, Division 3 or Group U, or

accessory sheds or one story buildings not greater than two thousand square feet, which

are accessory to detached one or two family dwellings, or are accessory to Group R,

Division 3 occupancies, may alternatively comply with K.C.C. 16.06.050, with the

approval of the building ofhcial.

EXCEPTIONS:

2.1. Structures which are located in a seismic or landslidehazard area, as

designated on the King County sensitive area folio maps.

2.2. Structures with foundation or ground failures.

SECTION 59. Ordinance 14914, Section 290,andK.C.C. 16.06.033 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Required structural repair level for a damage ratio greater than fifty percent

(IBC ((34+l-33)) 3413.3.3). When the damage ratio is greater than fifty percent, all

structures shall have the entire structure strengthened to comply with the force levels and

connection requirements of the International Building Code.

SECTION 60. Ordinance 14914, Section 297, and K.C.C. 16.06.034 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:ro37

47



1038

1039

1040

1,041

ro42

ro43

1.O44

1045

1,046

ro47

1-048

1.O49

1050

1051

1.052

1053

1054

1055

1056

1.O57

1058

1059

Ordinance 17837

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Required structural repair level for critical structures (IBC ((34++-3+1))

3413.3.4). When the damage ratio for critical structures, except for structures identified

as essential facilities in seismic use Group IV, as listed in IBC Table 1604.5, is ten

percent or less, the critical structures may be restored to the pre-event condition, except

as noted in this section. When the damage ratio for critical structures is greater than ten

percent but no greater than thirty percent, and for essential facilities when the damage

ratio is greater than five percent but no greater than thirty percent, structures shall have

the damaged structural members, including all critical ties and connections associated

with the damaged structural members, all structural members supported by the damaged

member, and all structural members supporting the damaged members repaired, replaced

or strengthened to bring them into compliance with the connection requirements and

eighty percent of the force levels of the International Building Code. When the damage

ratio for critical structures and essential facilities as listed in seismic use Group IV IBC

Table_l604.5, is greater than thirty percent, the entire structure shall be strengthened to

comply with the force levels and connection requirements of the International Building

Code.

EXCEPTION: The top two levels of a four or more level structure may meet a

lesser criteria than having those levels strengthened to comply with the force levels and

connection requirements of the International Building Code, provided that the criteria is

not less than that which those levels would be subject to if they were in a two level

structure, based on the damage they incurred,1060

48



1061

1.O62

1063

1064

1065

1066

ro67

1068

1069

ro70

ro71

ro72

ro73

ro74

to75

1.076

1.O77

1.078

1.079

1080

Ordinance 17837

SECTION 61. Ordinance 14914, Section 292, and K.C.C. 16.06.035 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Exception to the required structural repair level for Group H occupancies

(IBC ((34+J-35)) 3413.3.5). When the structure owner can demonstrate that Group H

occupancies are of a minor or accessory nature, the building offrcial may designate the

structure as other than a critical structure for structural repair design criteria purposes.

SECTION 62. Ordinance 14238, Section 21, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.040

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Special provisions (IBC 3411.4). The following special provision shall apply

when the damage ratio is greater than ten percent:

1. A structure containing an occupancy classif,red as Group R or any townhouse

structure, which contains five or more dwelling units and which contains parking shall

have any level containing parking and the connections of any parking level to adjacent

levels strengthened to comply with the force levels and connection requirements of the

International Building Code.

EXCEPTION: A wood-frame structure of one or two stories or one story and a

basement, provided that no dwelling units are located above parking areas.1081

49



to82

1083

1084

1085

1086

1,087

1088

1089

1090

1091

1.092

L093

1.O94

1095

1096

1.097

1098

1099

L100

1101

1.1,02

Ordinance 17837

2. A structure having concrete tilt-up or masoffy bearing walls shall be provided

with a positive connection between the walls and roof diaphragm sized in accordance

with the International Building Code.

3. A masonry structure, constructed without structural reinforcement or

reinforced only with joint reinforcement, which has not been identified as an essential

facility classified as Category IV for ((impe+anee-Aeter)) risk categor)'as listed in Table

1604.5IBC and does not contain Group H occupancies shall comply with the

International Existing Building Code Appendix Chapter A1. These structures, which are

identified as essential facilities and listed in Category IV for ((imper+anee+¿e+er)) dsk

category as defined by Table 1604.5IBC or contain Group H occupancies shall have the

entire structure strengthened to comply with the force levels and connection requirements

of the International Building Code.

4. For repairs to structures located in a seismi c hazard area, as identified on the

King County sensitive areas map folio, consideration shall be given to potential

consequences of any liquifaction and soil strength loss, including estimation of

differential settlement, lateral movement or reduction in foundation soil bearing capacity

in accordance with a foundation investigation as required by IBC ((l€02)) 1803.

5. For repairs to structures located in a landsli de hazard aÍea, as identified on the

King County sensitive areas map folio, an evaluation of the risks shall be made by a

geotechnical engineer. Where excessive risk exists and cannot be mitigated, repair is

prohibited, when the ratio of the estimated value of the repairs required to restore the

structural members to their pre-event condition to the estimated replacement value of the1103

50



1.1.O4

1105

1106

1.1.07

1108

1109

1110

TtlT

11.12

1.1.1.3

1.1.1,4

1115

1.1.L6

1.1.17

1118

1.1.19

1,1,20

1,121,

1.1,22

1.1.23

1,124

1.1.25

Ordinance 17837

structure exceeds thirty percent. Repair proposals and construction shall be in

conformance with recommendations of the geotechnical engineer of record.

SECTION 63. Ordinance 14238, Section 22, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.050

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Alternative residential provisions (IBC ((34+l-5)) 3413.5). When the structure

is not a critical structure and the damage ratio is greater than ten percent, but less than

fifty percent, conventional stud framed structures which contain detached one or two

family dwellings, or occupancies classif,red as Group.R, Division 3 or Group U or

accessory sheds or buildings one story in height and not greater than two thousand square

feet, which are accessory to detached one and two family dwellings, or are accessory to

Group R, Division 3 occupancies, shall, at a minimum, be restored to their pre-event

condition.

EXCEPTION:

1. Structures more than 3 stories in height shall comply with IBC ((34+l-3))

3413.3 as modified by the codes.

2. On sites in seismic design category D2 as described in IRC Table R301.2(1)

and on sites 2000 feet or more above seal level, repair of buildings and structures in

accordance with this subsection is limited to repair of buildings or structures or one or

two stories in height.

3. On sites 2500 feet or more above sea level, repair of buildings and structures in

accordance with this section is limited to repair of one story in height structures.1,1,26

51



Ordinance 17837

L127

1,128

1.1.29

1130

1.1.31.

1,132

1133

1.1.34

1135

r1.36

1.1.37

1138

1139

11.40

11.41

11,42

1.1,43

1.1.44

1_1.45

1.146

1.147

If structures are restored to their pre-event condition, the following provisions

also apply:

1. Damaged required braced panels shall be repaired or replaced.

2. The wood frame shall be attached to the foundation with not less than the

following, or its equivalent: one-half inch anchor bolt at six feet on center where one

floor is supporled on the foundation; or one-half inch anchor bolt at four feet on center

where two or three stories are supported on the foundation. Where technically feasible,

anchor bolts shall comply with ((IBê23O!3.{*)) IRC R602.11, however where

compliance with ((IB€43€5J=1a)) IRC R602.11 is not technically feasible, each

foundation bolt newly installed for compliance with this section shall be provided with

plate washers a minimum of two inch by two inch by three-sixteenths inch thick. Where

the sill plates are exposed during construction, to the degree feasible, provide anchor

bolts in accordance with this section or provide equivalent anchorage.

3. At each level, in each direction, minimum bracing shall be provided as

follows:

3.I . Braced wall panels shall be in a quantity such that the total amount of

braced wall panels shall be not be less than eighteen percent of the building width at first

story of two stories in height, or second story of three stories in height.

3 ,2, The total amount of braced wall panels shall be not less than thir"ty percent

of the building width at the first story of three stories in height.

3.3. Construction of braced wall panels shall be one of the following methods

((1.1.48

52



Ordinance 17837

TT49

11s0 +is+i+e));

1151 a. Wood structural oanel sheathins a thickness of not less than 3/8 inch

LL52 for 16-inch or 24-inch stud spacing:

L Particleboard wall sheafl".i- - ^o-ol c L^-^ i--+^ll^,{ :- ^^^^*,{^-^^ "'i+L TDll1153

1155

1.1.57

w

L1s4 Table R602.10.4

11s6 R602.10.4: or

c. Hardboard panel sidine where in accordance with IRC Table

d. An aooroved shear oanel where all elements comnlv with the nrovisions

1158 of the listine.

1159 3.4. Braced wall panels shall be installed so that there is no unbraced section

along the wall exceeding thirty-two feet, except that braced wall panels shall be installed

so there is no unbraced section along the wall exceeding twenty-five feet at the first story

of three stories in height.

3.5. No braced wall panel less than two feet in width shall be considered to

satisfy a portion of the overall length requirement, unless fully complying with the listing

of an approved wall panel or ((

@ing)) IRC R602. 1 2.6 - Narrow Panels.

3.6. Braced wall panels shall be provided with ties to the wall below or to the

foundation to resist overlurning where the braced wall panel is less than three feet in

width at the first and second story of three stories in height and first of two stories in

height.

1160

1.1.61.

1.1.62

1.1.63

1.1.64

1165

r1,66

L1,67

1168

1169

1.170

53



1.171.

1.172

TT73

1.I7 4

1.17s

1.176

1.177

IT78

1179

1180

1181

1182

1183

11.84

1185

L186

1.1.87

1188

1189

1190

1.r91.

1,192

Ordinance 17837

SECTION 64. Ordinance 14238, Section 23, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.060

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Nonstructural repairs to light fïxtures and suspended ceilings (IBC ((34+l-6))

3413.6). Regardless of the damage ratio, when light fixtures and the suspension system

of suspended ceilings are damaged, the damaged light f,rxtures and suspension systems

shall be required to fully comply with the requirements of this code, ASTM C 635 and

ASTM C 636. Undamaged light fixtures and suspension systems shall have the

additional support and bracing, provided that is required in ASTM C 635 and ASTM C

636.

SECTION 65. Ordinance 14238, Section 24, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.06.070

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Repair criteria for masonry chimneys (IBC ((34+l-+)) 3413.7).

1. All damaged masoffy chimneys must be repaired or reconstructed to comply

with the requirements of IBC ((21-13)) 2IIl, repaired or reconstructed with pre-

manufactured chimneys or they shall be removed. When only a portion of the masonry

chimney requires repair, damaged portions of chimneys shall be removed and repaired in

accordance with the following criteria:

L 1 . When the damaged portion of the chimney is located between the roof line

and the top of the chimney, the damaged portion shall be removed to the roof line1193

54



Ordinance 17837

provided the roof and ceiling anchorage are in sound condition. The reconstructed

portion of the chimney shall be braced to the roof structure.

1 .2. For a single story structure in which the damaged portion of the chimney is

below the roofline or the damaged portion extends from above the roofline to below the

roofline, the chimney shall be removed to the top of the fireplace.

1.3. For a multistory structure, the damaged portion of the chimney shall be

removed from the top to a floor line where sound anchorage is found.

1.4. In any structure where the firebox has been damaged, the entire chimney

and firebox shall be removed to the foundation. If the fireplace foundation is in sound

condition, the f,rrebox and chimney may be reconstructed using the existing foundation.

If the fireplace foundation has been damaged, the fireplace foundation shall be removed

and replaced.

2. V/here existing conditions preclude the installation of all anchorage required

by IBC ((2113)) 217I, alternate systems may be used in accordance with the alternate

methods and materials provisions of the cunent code when approved by the building

off,rcial. Such alternate systems shall be designed and detailed by a structural engineer,

civil engineer or architect.

3. When the portion of the chimney extending above the roof line exceeds three

times the least dimension of the chimney, that portion above the roof line shall be braced

to the roof structure.

SECTION 66. Ordinance 14238, Section 25, as amended, and K.C.C, 16.06.080

1,21,5 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

1.1.94

1195

1196

1.r97

1198

1,1,99

1200

1201.

1202

1203

1.204

1205

1.206

1.207

I208

r209

12TO

121,1,

1212

121.3

I2I4

55



Ordinance 17837

121,6

1217

121,8

121,9

r220

122r

1222

1223

r224

r225

r226

1227

!228

1.229

I230

1.231

1.232

r233

1234

r235

1236

Chapter 34 Existing Structures of the International Building Code is

supplemented with the following:

Certified compliance program for nonstructural and "stand-alone"

structural repairs (IBC ((34+l-8)) 3413.8). The building official may establish a

certified compliance program by public rule in accordance with K.C.C. chapter 2.98.

This program will allow certain repairs to disaster damaged structures through an issued

building permit without requiring an engineered repair design and without submitting

plans for review by King County.

1. Repairs authorized under this program will be where the damage is limited to

nonstructural components, such as chimneys and stand-alone structural systems, such as

masoffy or concrete masoffy walls.

2. The program would require that nonstructural and stand-alone structural

repairs be performed only by registered contractors who can demonstrate competence in

standards set forth in the public rule.

3. The program may waive the requirement for inspection of the nonstructural

and stand¡alone structural repairs, provided the registered contlactor provides

certification that the repairs have been completed in accordance with the approved permit

and the repair criteria.

4. Repair criteria and required standards for registered contractors shall be set

forth in the public rule.

SECTION 67 Ordinance 14111, Section 1 18, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.12.010

1237 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

56



Ordinance 17837

The ((2009)) 2}l2lnternational Mechanical Code, with Appendix A, as amended

in chapter 5I-52 WAC effective July 1, ((201€)) 2013, as published by or jointly with the

International Code Council, Inc, together with amendments, additions and deletions

hereinafter adopted by reference, together with the state building code and with King

County modifications which shall be adopted and codified in this chapter are adopted as

the King County mechanical code and hereinafter refemed to as "IMC."

SECTION 68. Ordinance 14111 , Section 729,as amended, and K.C.C. 16.14.010

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

The International Property Maintenance Code, ((2009)) 2012 Edition, as

published by the International Code Council, together with amendments, additions and

deletions hereinafter adopted by reference, together with King County modifications

which shall be adopted and codified in this chapter are adopted as the King County

property maintenance code and hereinafter referred to as "IPMC," Chapter 8, Referenced

Standards, is not adopted.

SECTION 69. Ordinance 12560, Section 109, as amended, and K.C,C. 16.14.090

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+44-4)) 104.3 of the International Property Maintenance Code is not

adopted and the following is substituted:

Right of entry GPMC ((+O44)) 104.3). The right of entry shall be in accordance

with the procedures specif,red in K.C.C. Title23.

SECTION 70. Ordinance 6746 , Section 5, as amended, and K,C.C. 16.32.030 are

I238

1.239

1.240

1.241.

1.242

1243

1244

1245

1246

1247

1248

1.249

1250

r251.

1.252

r253

1.254

1255

1.256

1257

1.258

1.259 each hereby amended to read as follows:

57



1260

1261.

1.262

1263

1.264

1.265

1266

1267

1268

1.269

r270

1271,

1272

1.273

I274

1.275

1.276

1277

1.278

1.279

1280

1.281.

Ordinance 17837

A. Chapters 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 13, 14, ((and)) 16. and 17 and

Appendix A, B, and I of the Uniform Plumbing Code, ((2009)) 2012 Edition, as

published by or jointly with the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical

Officials and as amended in chapter((s)) 51-56 WAC ((an++t-S+W+e)), and the gas

piping provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code, ((2009)) 2012Edition, the National

Fuel Gas Code, ((2009)) 2012Edition (((2009)) 2012 ANSI Z223.llNFPA 54), the

Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code, ((2008)) 2011 Edition (((2008)) 2011 NFPA 58) as

amended in chapter 51-52 WAC, and the International Residential Code, ((æAÐ) 2012

Edition, as amended in chapter 5 1-51 
'WAC, 

are hereby adopted and together with King

County amendments, additions and deletions adopted in this chapter are adopted as the

King County Plumbing Code and may be cited as such and referred to in this chapter as

"this code." This code shall have precedence over documents adopted by reference.

B. This code also may be further clarified and implemented by administrative

rules adopted in accordance with K.C.C. chapter 2.98.

SECTION 71. Ordinance 15802 , Section 131, and K.C.C. 16.32.285 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 103.3.3 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is not adopted and the following

is substituted:

Validify of Permit (UPC 103.3.3). The issuance of a permit or approval of plans

and specifications shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an approval of, any

violation of any of the provisions of this code or of any other ordinance of the

jurisdiction. No permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of

this code shall be valid.1.282

58



1283

1.284

1.285

1.286

1.287

1.288

1289

1290

1.291

1.292

1293

1294

1295

1.296

1.297

1.298

I299

1300

1301

1302

1303

1.304

Ordinance 17837

The issuance of a permit based upon plans, specifications or other data shall not

prevent the authority having jurisdiction from thereafter requiring the correction of errors

contained in said plans, specifications and other data or from preventing building

operations being carried on thereunder when in violation of this code or of other

ordinances of this jurisdiction.

Every plumbing permit shall be kept on the site where the work permitted is being

performed and shall not be removed until the work has been f,rnally approved by the

authority having j urisdiction.

Every permit issued by the authority having jurisdiction under the provisions of

this code shall expire by limitation and become null and void one year from date of issue.

Permits expired for not more than one year may be renewed one time only for one-half

the original cost or fifty dollars ($50), whichever is less. Any person seeking renewal of

a permit expired for more than one year shall pay the full amount of the original permit

cost in accordance with the fee schedule.

Plumbing work authorizedby a permit in effect on or after July 1, ((2007)) 2073,

shall be performed in accordance with the laws and ordinances in effect when the permit

was issued, except when the authority having jurisdiction determines such work to be in

fact dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or a nuisance or a menace to life, health or property.

SECTION 72. Ordinance 15802, Section 131, and K.C.C. 17.04.010 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

The International Fire Code ((2006)) 2012 Edition, as published by the

International Code Council, as amended in chapter 5l-54A WAC, effective July 1,

((20€7)) 2013, together with amendments, additions, and deletions adopted in this chapter1305

59



1306

1.307

1308

1309

1310

1.31.r

1.31.2

1313

1.31.4

1315

1.31.6

t3t7

1318

13 19

1.320

1321,

1322

1323

r324

1325

1326

1.327

Ordinance 17837

by reference, together with King County modif,rcations are adopted as the Fire Code of

King County, and referred to in this chapter as "this code." Administrative rules may be

adopted in accordance with K.C.C. chapter 2.98 to further clarify and implement these

code requirements. The King County modif,rcations shall be codified in this chapter.((t))

SECTION 73. Ordinance 15802, Section 131, and K.C.C. 17 .04.020 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Whenever the following words appear in this code, they are to be changed as

follows:

A. "Department" to "department of permr ttins and environmental review,"

B. "Fire chief', "chief of the fire department," "fire prevention engineer" and

"fire code official" to "King County fire marshal".

((+)) C. "File department" to "((@i+ision)) department

of permitting and environmental review."

((e , "Ðepartment" te "the department ef permitting and envirenmental revierv,"))

SECTION 74. Ordinance 12560, Section 154, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.230

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section i04.1 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the following:

Duties of the fire marshal ((di+isie+)) and fire districts (IFC 104.1.3).

1. The fire marshal shall have responsibility for administration and inspection

functions to promote compliance of the fire prevention provisions of this code.

2. The Chiefs of the King County Fire Districts and Fire Deparlments shall have

responsibility for fire suppression or extinguishing provisions of this code within their

respective j urisdictions.1328

60



1,329

L330

1331

1.332

1333

1,334

1335

1336

1.337

1338

1339

1.340

1341,

1.342

1.343

1.344

1.345

1346

1.347

1348

1.349

1350

Ordinance 17837

3. The fire marshal may, by written contract, delegate to the chiefs of the fire

districts ol fire departments authority for inspections of the f,rre prevention provisions of

this code within their lespective jurisdictions.

4. The fire marshal may, at the request of a fire districts or fire department,

assume an advisory status in matters of operations, function, expenditure, tactics,

personnel and equipment or any other function performed by the f,rre district or fire

department.

NEW SECTION. SECTION 15. A new section is hereby added to K.C.C.

chapter 17.04 to read as follows:

Section 105.7 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the following:

Solar photovoltaic power systems (IFC 105.7.13). A construction permit is

required to install or modify solar photovoltaic power systems.

Exception: Roof-mounted photo-voltaic solar panels on one and two family

dwellings that have a total dead load not exceeding three pounds per square foot and are

mounted no more than eighteen inches above the roof or highest roof point on which they

are mounted.

SECTION 76. Ordinance l4ll1, Section 203, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.470

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((5O8é)) 501.5 of the International Fire Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Fire hydrant systems (IFC ((5085)) 507.5). Fire hydrant systems shall be in

accordance with the procedures specified in King County water-main and fire hydrant

provisions, K.C.C. chapter 17.08.1351

61



Ordinance 17837

SECTION 77, Ordinance 14111, Section 273, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.490

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 901.4 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the following:

Modifications (IFC ((901-45)) 901.4.7). V/hen changes, alterations or additions

to an existing sprinkler system are made that involve 10 or less sprinkler heads, a permit

is not required if a final inspection andlor acceptance test is witnessed by, and as-built

plans are submitted to the Fire Marshal.

SECTION 78. Ordinance l4lll, Section 270, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.510

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 901 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the following:

Marking of fire-protection equipment and fïre hydrants (IFC ((901-+0))

901.11). Fire-protection equipment and hre hydrants shall be clearly identified in an

approved manner to prevent obstruction by parking and other obstructions.

1. All fire department connections shall have a sign complying with the

International Fire Code or as approved by the Fire Marshal. The sign shall specify what

type of water-based fire protection system it serves and building areas served.

2. All main control valves and sectional valves for water-based fire protection

system shall have a sign specifying what the valves control.

3. All sprinklers and standpipe risers shall have signs indicating the type of

water-based fire protection system it is.

SECTION 79. Ordinance 15803 , Section 6, and K.C.C. 17 .04.522 are each

1,352

1353

1.354

1355

1356

1357

1358

1359

1360

1.361.

1.362

1363

1364

1365

1.366

1367

L368

1369

1,370

1,371,

1.372

1373 hereby amended to read as follows

62



Ordinance 17837

r374

1.375

1.376

1.377

1318

1379

1380

1381

1.382

1383

1.384

1385

1386

1.387

1388

1389

1390

1391

1.392

1393

1,394

1395

Section (eAæÐ 903.2.3 of the International Fire Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Automatic sprinkler systems - Group E (IFC (90}}3)) 903.2.3). An

automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E occupancies.

Exceptions((l)i

1. Portable school classrooms, provided the aggregate area of any cluster or

portion of a cluster of portable school classrooms does not exceed 5,000 square feet

(I465m2) and clusters of portable school classrooms shall be separated as required in

Chapter 5 of the building code.

2. Group E Occupancies with an occupant load of 50 or less, not including

daycare facilities that provide care for more than 12 children 2 l12 years of age or less.

SECTION 80. Ordinance 6328, Section 4, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.530 are

each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((9W))903.2.8 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with

the following:

Senior citizen apartments (IFC (903J-7'f)) 903.2.8.3). All senior citizen

apartments defined as, a room or a suite of two or more rooms in a duplex or multi-family

structure for which occupancy of the structure has been limited to persons age sixty-two

or older by covenant or deed restriction in which King County is granted enforcement

authority, which are four stories or more in height shall be protected throughout by an

approved automatic sprinkler system.

SECTION 81. Ordinance l4Il1, Section 2I5, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.540

are each hereby amended to read as follows:1396

63



1.397

1398

1399

1400

1,401.

L402

1403

r404

1405

1406

r41.0

'J.41.'1.

1.41.2

1-407

1408 exclusively for telecommunications eq associated electrical Dower distribution

1.409 equipment, batteries and standby engines. provided those spaces or areas are equipped

Ordinance 17837

Section ((903=2=1s)) 903.2 of the International Fire Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

((++-eeeupaneies)) Where required (IFC ((90æ)) 903.2. Sprinklers are

required as follows:

1. For residential units and their accessory structures built under the International

Residential Code, sprinklers shall be installed as set forth in Section ((903.?*o.zl))

903.2.13.

2. For all other occupancies an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in

thelocationssetforthinSection((90#-l))903.2.IthroughSection((9o#))

903.2.12.

constructed in accordance with Section 707 or not less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies

L413 constructed in accordance with Section 711 or both

1.41.4 3. Sprinklers are required in all occupancies requiring 2,000 gallons per minute

or more fire flow, or where the total floor area included within the surrounding exterior

walls on all floor levels including basements exceeds 10,000 square feet. ((trire

be eensidered te separate a building te enable deletien ef the required atrtematie sprinkler

sys+cm,))

1.415

1.41.6

r417

1,41,8

1.41.9

64



1,420

1.421

r422

1.423

1.424

1.425

1.426

1427

1428

1,429

L430

1,43r

1.432

1.433

1.434

1.435

1.436

1.437

1.438

1.439

1.440

Ordinance 17837

NEW SECTION. SECTION 82. A new section is hereby added to K.C.C.

chapter 17.04 to read as follows:

Section 903.2 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the following:

IRC occupancies (IFC 903.2.13). An automatic sprinkler system shall be

installed in residential units and accessory structures built under the International

Residential Code as follows:

1. The gross floor area exceeds 2,500 square feet (including attached garages)

without adequate fire flow except as cited in K.C.C. 17.08.030;

2. There is no approved fire department access as defined in the road standards of

K.C.C. Title 14; and

3. Either 2,000 gallons per minute or more hre flow is required or the total floor

area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all floor levels, including

basements, exceeds 10,000 square feet. For townhouses each unit is considered a

separate building.

EXCEPTIONS: Attached decks, exterior porches and carports open on two

sides; or

4. 'Where special hazards or unusual conditions exist in addition to the normal

hazard of the space due to the design, size, volume or use of the space, the Fire Marshal

is authorized to require additional safeguards suitable for the protection of the hazard or

condition involved. Additional safeguards can consist of automatic fire alarm system,

automatic sprinkler or water spray system, standpipe and hose, fixed or portable hre

extinguishers, or other special fire-extinguishing systems. Where such systems are144r

65



1.444

1.445

r446

1.447

1.448

1.449

1450

r451.

1.452

1.453

1.454

1_455

Ordinance 17837

1.442 provided, they shall be designed and installed in accordance with the applicable

1443 International Fire Code Standards

SECTION 83 Ordinance 14915, Section 79,and K.C.C. 17.04.550 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((903-2-+æ)) 903.2.1I.3 of the International Fire Code is not adopted

and the following is substituted:

Buildings more than fifty-fÏve feet in height (IFC ((90}3-1æ)) 903.2.11.3).

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings used for human

occupancy that are located 55 feet (16.76 m) or more above the lowest level of fire

department vehicle access.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Airport control towers.

2. Openparking structures.

SECTION 84. Ordinance 12560, Section 174, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.560

1,456 are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((903=2-1s)) 903.2.11of the International Fire Code is supplemented with

the following:

Residential units and accessory structures built under the IRC (IFC

((903J"1s.4)) 903.2.11.7). An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in structures

built under the International Residential Code (IRC) as follows:

t. ((gxeeeding)) The gross floor area exceeds 2,500 square feet ((gress-flêer

area)) (including attached garages) without adequate f,rre flow except as cited in K.C.C.

17.08.030;

1.457

1.458

1.459

1,460

1,46r

1,462

1.463

1,464

66



1.465

1,466

1,467

1468

1.469

1470

1.471.

1.472

1.473

1.474

1.475

1.476

1477

1,478

1,479

1480

t48r

1.482

1.483

1484

1485

1,486

Ordinance 17837

2. ((Witheut)) There is no approved fire department access as defined in the King

County road standards and IFC 503, as amended; or

3. If 2,000 gallons per minute or more fire flow is required or where the total

floor area included within the surrounding exterior walls on all floor levels including

basements exceeds 10,000 square feet. For townhouses, each unit is considered a

separate building.

EXCEPTIONS: Attached decks, exterior porches and carports open on two

sides.

4. Where special hazards or unusual conditions exists in addition to the normal

hazard of the space due to the design, size, volume or use of the space, the Fire Marshal

is authorized to require additional safeguards suitable for the protection of the hazard or

condition involved. Additional safeguards can consist of automatic fire alarm system,

automatic sprinkler or water spray system, standpipe and hose, fixed or portable fìre

extinguishers, or other special fire-extinguishing systems. Where such systems are

provided, they shall be designed and installed in accordance with the International Fire

Code.

SECTION 85. Ordinance 14238, Section 29, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.600

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((14+l)) 3301 of the International File Code is supplemented with the

following:

Disaster damage - purpose (IFC ((+4013)) 3301.3). The purpose of K.C.C.

17.04.610 and 17.04.620 is to provide a defined level of repair for buildings and

structures damaged as a result of a disaster has been declared accordance with K.C.C.1,487

67



1488

1489

1490

1,491,

1,492

1.493

1.494

1495

1,496

1,497

1,498

1.499

1500

1501

1,502

1503

1s04

1505

1506

1.507

1508

1509

Ordinance 17837

chapter 12.52, ((+ne-previsøns-eÐ) K.C.C. 17.04.610 through 17.04.620 are not

intended to modify requirements that would otherwise apply under the Washington state

energy code, chapter 19.27 A RCW or provisions in buildings for aged and handicapped

persons, chapter 70.92 RCW.

SECTION 86. Ordinance 14238, Section 30, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.610

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((+40+)) 3301 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the

following:

Rescue access and fire protection system requirements for structures

damaged by disaster (IFC ((+401-+f)) 3301.3.1). Structures damaged as a result of an

emergency declared in accordance with K.C.C. chapter 12.52, that do not comply with

K.C.C. 17 .04.440 (Life safety/rescue access - Section 504.3), K.C.C. 17 .04.520 (Ffue

extinguishing systems - Section 903.1) or K.C.C. 17.04.580 (Fire detection systems -

Section 907.I), shall comply with current code based on the ratio of the estimated value

of the repairs required to restore the structural members to the pre-event condition to the

estimated replacement value of the structure as follow:

1. When the damage ratio is thirty percent or less, structures will not be required

to be retrofitted to comply with K.C.C . 17 .04.440 (Life safety/rescue access - Section

504.3), K.C.C. 17 .04.520 (Fire extinguishing systems - Section 903.1) or K.C.C.

17.04.580 (Fire detection systems - Section 907.I).

2. V/hen the damage ratio is greater than thirty percent but less than f,rfty percent,

structures shall comply with K.C.C. 17 .04.440 (Life safety/rescue access - Section

504.3), K.C.C. 17.04.520 (Fire extinguishing systems - Section 903.1) and K.C,C.1510

68



1511

1.51.2

1513

1.51.4

15L5

1,51,6

1.517

1518

1519

1.520

1.52I

1.522

ts23

1.524

1.525

1.526

1.527

1.528

1.529

1530

1531

Ordinance 17837

17.04.580 (Fire detection systems - Section 901.1), to the degree feasible. When full

compliance with K.C.C . 17 .04.520 (Fire extinguishing systems - Section 903.1) is found

to not be feasible due to insufficient water availability,pafüal coverage may be required.

Feasibility shall be determined by the fire marshal using the following factors:

2.1. W afer availability;

2.2. Existing configuration off the structure;

2.3. Existing configuration of the site and access;

2.4. Whether repairs will extend the useful life of the structure;

2.5, Projected length of the economic life of the structure;

2.6. Existing or proposed area separation walls;

2.7. Extent of the proposed noncompliance;

2.8. Extent of repairs;

2.9. Use, occupant load, or fire load of the facility; and

2. 10. Economic considerations.

3. V/hen the damage ratio is fifty percent or greater, structures shall meet full

compliance with K.C.C. 17.04.440 (Life safety/rescue access - Section 504.3), K.C.C.

17 .04.520 (Fire extinguishing systems - Section 903.1) and K.C.C. 17.04.580 (Fire

detection systems - Section 907.1).

SECTION 87. Ordinance 14238, Section 31, as amended, and K.C.C. 17.04.620

are each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section ((140+)) 3301 of the International Fire Code is supplemented with the

following:1.532

69



1533

1534

1535

1536

1537

1s38

1539

1.540

1.541.

1.542

1.543

1.544

1545

1546

1.541

L548

L549

1550

1551

1.552

1553

Ordinance 17837

Repairing and replacing existing fTre protection systems damaged by a

disaster (IFC ((1401-33)) 330f .3.2). Existing fire extinguishing systems and hre

detection systems damaged as a result of an emergency declared in accordance with

K.C.C. chapter 12.52, shall comply as follows:

1. When damage to an existing fire extinguishing system or fire detection system

requires repair, replacement or both, totaling less than or equal to ten percent of the

system, it may be repaired or replaced to the code requirements in effect at the time the

system was installed.

2. V/hen the damage to an existing fire extinguishing system or fire detection

system requires repair, replacement or both, totaling more than ten percent, but less than

fìfty percent of the system, the damaged portions of the system must be brought into

compliance with the current code requirements.

3. V/hen the damage to an existing f,rre extinguishing system or fire detection

system requires repair, replacement or both totaling f,rfty percent or more of the system,

the entire system must be brought into compliance with current code requirements.

SECTION 88. Ordinance 9726, Section 1, as amended, and K,C.C. 17.04.630 arc

each hereby amended to read as follows:

Section (Q4AÆ)) 5704.4.2 of the International Fire Code is not adopted and the

following is substituted:

Location on properfy. Outdoor storage of liquids in containers and portable

tanks shall be in accordance with Table ((349Æ)) 5704.4.2. Storage of liquids near

buildings located on the same property shall be in accordance with this section.1554

70



1555

1556

1.557

1558

1559

1560

L561

1.562

1563

1,564

1565

1566

1.567

1568

1569

1,570

1.511.

1.572

1.573

1.574

1.575

Ordinance 17837

EXCEPTION: Outdoor storage of flammable liquids in excess of ten gallons is

not permitted on property used for single family, duplex and townhouse dwellings.

SECTION 89. Ordinance 10870 , Section 377, and K.C.C. 2IA.I4.7J0 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

As an alternative to the building separation and internal street standards of K.C.C

2TA.T4.T60:

A. Building separation requirements or setbacks between mobile homes and

accessory structures on adjacent spaces may be modihed, provided:

1. The common walls meet the fire protection standards set forlh in the

((t+ni+rm)) International Building Code and the standards set forth in the (({Jniferm))

International Fire Code for duplexes, multifamily and condominium developments, as

applicable; and

2. Rental agreement clauses, by-laws or other legal mechanisms stipulate

maintenance responsibilities for structures, fences and yards;

B. Private streets may be used with a minimum driving surface of 22 feet in

width, provided:

1. The streets comply in all other respects with the road standards;

2. All required parking is located off-street and as specified in K.C.C.

2IA.l4.I60E; and

3. Such streets shall not:

a. directly connect two or more points of vehicular access to the park; or

b. serve over 100 dwelling units within the park,1.576

71



Ordinance 17837

1.517

1.578

1,579

1580

1581

1.582

1583

1584

1585

1586

1587

1588

1589

1s90

1591

1.592

1593

r594

1595

1596

1.597

SECTION 90 Ordinance 10870, Section 523,and K.C.C. 21A.28.130 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

All new development shall be served by adequate fire protection as set forth

below:

A. The site of the development proposed is served by a water supply system that

provides at least minimum fire flow and a, road system or fire lane system that provides

life safety/rescue access, and other fire protection requirements for buildings as required

by K.C.C. Title 17, Fire Code and K.C.C. Title 16, Building and Construction Standards;

B. For azone reclassification or Urban planned development, the timing of

installation of required fire protection improvements shall be stated in the approving

ordinance as specified in K.C.C. 20.24.230, secured with a bond or similar security, and

deposited with King County; and

C. A variance request from the requirements established by K.C.C. Title 17, Fire

Code, shall be reviewed as set forth in K.C.C. 17.08.090 or K.C.C. 17.10.040, and/or in

Article 2 of the currently adopted edition of the ((t++ifsrm)) International Fire Code and

does not require a variance from this title unless relief is requested from a building

height, setback, landscaping or other development standard set forth in K.C.C. 2IA.l2

through K.C.C. 2I1'30.

SECTION 91. Ordinance 108 70, Section 539, and K.C.C. 2IA.32.020 are each

hereby amended to read as follows:

A, V/ith the exception of nonconforming extractive operations identified in

K.C.C. 2IA.22, all nonconformances shall be subject to the provisions of this chapter1598

72



1599

1600

1601

1605

Ordinance 17837

n. (Gheæ+e+isiens-ef+))This chapter ((ds)) does not supersede or relieve a

property owner from compliance with:

1, The ((rcqui#)) International Building and Fire Codes;

1602 or

1603 2. The provisions of this code beyond the specific nonconformance addressed

1604 by this chapter

SECTION 92. Ordinance 12024, Section 12, and K.C.C. 21A.32.230 are each

1606 hereby amended to read as follows:

It is unlawful for any person to keep, maintain or deposit on any properly in the

county a public nuisance including, but not limited to, the following:

A. Open storage of rubbish or junk including, but not limited to, refuse, garbage,

scrap metal or lumber, concrete, asphalt, tin cans, tires and piles of earth, not including

compost bins.

B. Combustible material likely to become easily ignited or debris resulting from

any fire and which constitutes aftrehazard, as defined in the ((t+nifenn)) International

Fire Code as adopted ((@)) under K.C.C. 17.04.0i0.

C. Abandoned vehicles, wrecked, dismantled or inoperative vehicles or remnant

parts thereof except as provided in K.C.C. 23.10.040.

SECTION 93. The following are each hereby repealed:

A. Ordinance 14974, Section 19, and K.C.C. 16.02.220;

B. Ordinance 15802, Section 9,and K.C.C. 16.02.315:

C. Ordinance 12560, Section 72, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.320;

D. Ordinance 149\4, Section 37, and K.C.C. 16.02.330:

1.607

1608

1609

1610

1.61.L

1,612

1.61.3

161,4

1615

1616

T617

1618

1.61.9

1.620

1,621

73



Ordinance 17837

1622

1_623

1,624

t625

t626

1.627

E. Ordinance 14914, Section 50, and K.C.C. 16.02.390:'

F. Ordinance 14974, Section 56, and K.C.C. 16.02.430;

G. Ordinance 12560, Section 29, as amended, and K.C.C. 16.02.460;

H, Ordinance 14914, Section 90, and K.C.C. 16.03.020;

I. Ordinance 12560, Section 40, as amended, and K.C.C.16.04.200;

J. Ordinance 12560, Section 4I, as amended, and K.C.C . 16.04.210;

74



Ordinance 17837

1,628

1,629

1630

K. Ordinance 14111, Section 43 as amended, and K.C.C. 16.04.280; and

L. Ordinance 15802, Section 23,and K.C.C. 16.04,350

Ordinance 17837 was introduced on l2l2l20I3 and passed by the Metropolitan King
County Council on 612312074,by the following vote:

Yes: 8 - Mr. Phillips, Mr. von Reichbauer, Mr. Gossett, Ms. Hague,
Ms. Lambert, Mr. Dunn, Mr. Dembowski and Mr. Upthegrove
No:0
Excused: 1 - Mr. McDermott

G

\)
-¿-

ATTEST:

Anne Noris, Clerk of the Council

Larry

2014.

{=- po* Constantine, County Executive

>ì
jt

li7
\/
iÌl
-

17ì"¡
ù

-l-{d
APPROVED this -\- day

Attachments z A.2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Atnendment Summary Table

75



ATTACHMENT A: 2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 2013-0480 - 17837

Comment
This allows each residential buìlding
on a site to have up to 500 sq. ft. to be

used for home occupation rather than
the cumulative area on a site limit(rd to
500 sq. ft. Provides for more flexibìlity
for home occupancy businesses

Updates of County Code to match
changes to State Code for energy
and ventilation code requirements.

Changes reference to Buildìng
Code Board; also see proposed
code change to 16.02.560

a

a

Ensure right ofentry code provisions
are maintained in a single code location

Continue to rely on existing King
County flood regulations

Broadens the exemption from
permit to include all agricultural
buildings less than 200 sq. ft. not
just storage buildings
Allows lor use olsmall swimming
pools in the summer. Enlorcing
permits for such structures not
feasible or needed

Clarifies shade cloth structure
exemption is not for general public
spaces

Facilitates installation of small
residential solar panels and wind
turbines.

a

o

a

a

'rooosal

Do not adopt IBC provision relating to
allowable modifi cations'"vithin the
flood hazard zone.

Remove limitation on agricultural
accessory buildings to tool and

storage sheds

Require oil derricks to obtain
building permits
Platforms are deleted to conform
with changes to the IBC a¡d IRC
Add exemption for prefabricated
swìmming pools ìnstalled for
temporary use for 3 months or less

are exempt lrom building permit
requrrements

Shade cloth structures are exempt
ifnot open to the public
Add exemption for roof-mounted
solar panels for one and two family
dwellings
Add exemption lor ground
mounted wind turbines less than 12

feet in height accessory to one and

two familv residences

a

a

a

a

a

IRC applies to anl,detached residential
building 500 sq. ft. or smaller used in
home occupation and home industry

Moved buildings must comply with
the lntemational Energy Code
Applicant may request revìew by
the Building Code Advisory Board

a

o

The IBC provision is not adopted and a

reference is added to the procedures for
code enforcement in K.C.C. Title 23.

The following are exempt from building
permit requirements:
. Agriculturalaccessorybuildings

used as tool and storage sheds that
are not used for vehicle storage and

are less than 200 sq. ft.
o Oil derricks
o Prefabricated swìmming pools

installed above ground
. Shade cÌoth structures for nursery

or agricultural purposes

Current Code

IRC applies to detached residenlial
buildings usetl in homc occupation
and home industry if total of all
detached structures is no more than
500 sq. ft.

a

Moved buildings must comply with
Washington State Energy Code and
Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality
Code
Applicant may requesf review by
the Building Code Appeals Board
if the building official denies a

relocation building permit

a

a

The IBC provision is not adopted

K.C.C. Ch. 21 4.24 governs allowable
modifications within the flood hazard
zone

Topic
Home occupations
and home industry

Moved and

temporary buildings

Right of entD,

Flood Hazard Area
Modificatìons

Permit exemptions

16.02.200

NEW
SECTION

16.02.240

K.C.C.
16.02.t52

16.02.110

King County Department of Perrnitting and Envir-onment Review
Prorrosed Buildine Code Undate

Section
3

4

7

8

9



ATTACHMENT A: 201 3 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 201 3-0480 - 17837

Simplifies code for reference and

malntenance.

The benefit ofrequiring placards is not
significant until reach floor loads of
1 25 psf.

This section is now not applicable

Retains existing King County treatment
for buildings over 65 feet.

Comrnent
Provides greater flexibility in allowing
applicants to respond to corrections
whi le maintaining Department's
f iduciary responsibilities.

Deletion ofexpired code sectionDelete authority for additional permit
extensions that expired in2012.

Add cross-reference to code section
establishing standards lor suspension or
revocation of a permit

Changes the IBC requirement to
placard floor loads for spaces from 50
psfto 125 psl
Fees are established by K.C.C. Title2T

a Rename to Building code advisory
board

Modifi provisions to clarify role as

advisory to the building official
Board may make recommendations
to the building olficial concerning
the building code.

o

o

Where the building code does not
define a term, the definìtions ìn K.C.C.
Title s 9. I 4. 194. 2l A. and 23 apolv.
IBC defines high rise buìldings as a

building with an occupied floor located
more than 75 feet above the lowest
level of fire department vehicle access.
The IBC definition is not adopted

Proposal
Add provision to allow the building
official to extend the time periods if the
applicant makes a request lor an

extension 7 days belore the expiration
and pays any applicable permit fees.

A building permit may be extended one
time if substantial work has commenced.
Until Dec. 31,2012, the building official
was authorized to grant additional
extensions even ifsubstantial work had

not commenced.
Building official may suspend, revoke,
or modify a permit approval if permit
was issued in error, on the basis of
inaccurate information, or in violation of
any ordinance
IBC 106.1 not adopted

Fees are established under K.C.C. Title
27 . PraÍe Tabte 1 -A published by ICBO
in the 1997 UBC is reprinted.
a Building code board ofappeals

established

Building official is an ex officio
member

Board decisions and findings are

advìsory unless code specifies
otherwise.
Board may make recommendations
to the county council concerning
the building code.

a

a

IBC defines terms used in the building
code

King County building code provisions
treat buildings 65 feet or taller as high
rise buildings.

Current Code
Permit applications are deemed canceled
if applicant fails to respond to request
for additional information within 60
days or the applicant fails to pick up the
permit withìn 60 days

Topic
Expiration of
application

Expiration of permit

Suspension or
revocation

Live loads posted

Fees

Building code
advisory board

Terms in other codes

Definitions not
adopted

K.C.C.

16.02.290

r 6.02.300

NEW
SECTION

16.02.400

16.02.560

NEW
SECTION

r 6.03.020

16.02.280

King County Department o1'Permitting and Environment Review
Pror¡osed Building Code Ur¡date

Section
10

ll

t2

t3

19

JJ

38

39

2



ATTACHMENT A: 2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 2013-0480 - 17837

The existing County code provides for
an altemative compliance path to
construct structural walls. Changes are

required to update construction details
to current standards references.

Comrncnt
Retains existing King County treatment
for buildings over 65 feet.

This is really due to a formatting
change. We had to add an existing IBC
section into the middle of the code due
to changes in the numbering sequence.

Fire separation walls are not used in
the current International Building or
Fire Code. The new code requires fire
walls that eflective ly separate ponions
of buildines.
The existing County code provides for
an altemative compliance path to
construct foundation walls. Changes
are required to update construction
details to current standards references.

The provision excluding fire separation
walls is deleted.

Revised to refer to applicable 2012 IRC
code provisions.

Revised to refer to applicable 2012 IRC
code provisions.

Exempts from the requirement for a

buitding permit installation of roof-
mounted solar panels meeting specific
loading requirements on one or two
story residences.
This section was revised due to changes

in formatting in the 2012 lFC. No
substantive changes of sprinkler
requirements.

This section was revised due to changes

in formatting in the 2012 IFC. No
substantive changes of sprinkler
requirements.

Proposal
A building with an occupied floor
located more than 65 feet above the
lowest level of fire department vehicle
access.

Adds exception for telecommunications
buildings with automatic sprinkler
systems and meeting other

uirements

Buildings over 3,000 sq. ft. are required
to have a fire detection system. Fire
separation walls do not eliminate the
requirement for a detection system.

Referred to provisions in the 2006 IRC
code.

Referred to provisions in the 2006 IRC
code.

Code provisions for fire sprinklers in
non-residential buildings.

Code provisions for fire sprinklers in
residential buildìngs.

Current Code
King County building code provisions
treat buildings 65 feet or taller as high
rise buildings.

Tonic
High-rise building
definition

Sprinklers - when
required

Fire detection
systems

Concrete Foundation
Walls

Alternative
Residential
Provisions

RooÊmounted solar
panels

Sprìnklers - where
required

Sprinklers - IRC
Occupancies

K.C.C.

r 6.04.3 10

16.04.340

16.05.090

16.06.050

NEW
SECTION

17.04.540

New Section

NEW
SECTION

King County Department of Perrnitting and Environment Review
Prorlosed Buildine Code Update

Section
40

43

46

53

63

75

81

82

J



ATTACHMENT A: 2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 2013-0480 - 17837

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

16.04.260
16.04.270
16.04.320
16.04.330
16.04.344
16.04.346
16.04.348
16.04.360
16.05.010
r 6.05.060

16.02.1l0
l6-02.130
16.02.180
16.02.190
16.02.340
16.02.350
16.02.360
16.02.370
16.02.3 80
r6.02.410
r6.02.420
16.02.440
r6.02.450
16.02.470
16.02.480
16.02.490
16.02.500
16.02.510
16.02.520
16.02.530
r6.02.s40
16.02.550
16.02.s70
16.02.580
r6.02.590
16.02.600

1

2

5

6
t4
l5
16

t7
l8
20
21

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
3l
32
34
35
36
37
4t
42
44
45
47
48
49
50

5l
52

4



ATTACHMENT A:2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 2013-0480 - 17837

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

Technical Corrections -update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments
Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and othgr minor amendments

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

Technical Corrections - update cross-references, dates, and other minor amendments

16.06.010
16.06.020
16.06.030
16.06.03 r

16.06.032
16.06.033
r 6.06.034
r6.06.035
16.06.040
16.06.060
16.06.070
16.06.080
16.12.010

16.14.0r0
16.14.090
16.32.030
16.32.285
17.04.010
17.04.020
r7.04.230
17.04.470
17.04.490
17.04.510
17.04.522
17.04.530
17.04.550
17.04.560
17.04.600
17.04.610
17.04.620
17.04.630
21A.14.170
21A.28.130
2rL32.020
211'.32.230

54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61

62
64
65
66
67

68
6:9

70
7l
72
t5
74
76

78
79
80
83

84
85

86
87
88

89
90
9l
92

5



ATTACHMENT A: 2013 Building and Fire Code Update - Amendment Summary Table - 2013-0480 - 17837

King County specific provisions are

no longer needed. Rely on
International Code provisions.
Provisions moved to other code
sections.

Alternative Designs
Construction Documents
Construction Documents
Construction documents
Temporary Power
Required Inspections
Certifi cate of Occupancy
Use or Occupancy - LC occupancies
High rise buildings
Special provisions
Vertical exist enclosure

16.02.220
t6.02.315
t6.02.320
16.02.330
r6.02.390
16.02.430
t6.02.460
16.04.200
16.04.210
16.04.280
16.04.3 50

Repealers93

6


